
1962-63.

THE PARLIAMENT OF THE COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA.

VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS
OF THE

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

No. 69.

THURSDAY, 28TH MARCH, 1963.

1. The House met, at half-past ten o'clock a.m., pursuant to adjournment.-Mr. Speaker (the Honorable
Sir John McLeay) took the Chair, and read Prayers.

2. PETmoNs.-Petitions from certain electors of New South Wales praying that the Government take urgent
and immediate action to (1) grant an increase in the pension and allowances of age, invalid and widow
pensioners, and (2) allocate additional finance for the building of low rental houses and units for
pensioners and elderly people were presented by Mr. Whitlam, Mr. Daly, Mr. Armitage, Mr. Monaghan,
Mr. Costa, Mr. Stewart, Mr. Einfeld, Mr. Uren, Mr. O'Connor, Mr. Curtin, Mr. Ward, Mr. Dean,
Mr. Kearney, Mr. England, Mr. James, Mr. Bate and Mr. Failes.

Petitions severally received.
Mr. Uren also presented a Petition from certain electors of the Commonwealth praying that the

Government (1) support the United Nations resolution for a Nuclear Test Ban Treaty, (2) ensure that
foreign bases are not permitted on Australian soil and (3) in response to the call of the United Nations,
declare Australia's willingness to enter into an agreement not to manufacture, test, station or acquire
nuclear weapons.

Petition received and read.

3. QUESTIONs.-Questions without notice were answered.

4. PAPERS.-The following Papers were presented, by command of His Excellency the Governor-
General-

Christmas Island-Report for year 1961-62.
Cocos (Keeling) Islands-Report for year 1961-62.
Treaties-Texts of-

(1) Declaration of 12th November, 1959, on the Provisional Accession of Tunisia to the
General Agreement on Tariffs and Trade, together with the Proces Verbal of 9th
December, 1961 extending the Declaration.

(2) Protocol of 9th May, 1962, establishing a Preparatory Group with a view to the creation
of a European Organization for the Development and Construction of Space Vehicle
Launchers, together with an Agreement supplementary thereto.

(3) War Graves Agreement between Indonesia and the Commonwealth Countries, signed
10th September, 1962.

(4) Exchange of Notes dated 11th September and 30th October, 1962, between Australia and
the United States of America, constituting an agreement to extend the operation of the
Agreement of 9th May, 1961, relating to Upper Atmosphere Sampling.

(5) Exchange of Notes dated 29th September, 1962, between Australia and the Netherlands,
constituting an Agreement to extend the Assisted Migration Agreement of 1st August,
1956.

F.2958/63.



384 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

(6) Agreements (3) between Australia, the Federation of Malaya and the State of Singapore
concerning the exchange of postal parcels and money orders between Malaya and
Singapore and Christmas Island, signed 16th October, 1962.

(7) Procs Verbal of 7th November, 1962 extending the Declaration of 18th November, 1960,
on the Provisional Accession of Argentina to the General Agreement on Tariffs and
Trade.

(8) International Coffee Agreement, dated 28th September, 1962.
(9) Exchange of Notes dated 26th November, 1962, between Australia and the Federation of

Malaya, constituting an Agreement concerning the reciprocal exchange of planting
material between the Federation and the Territory of Papua and New Guinea.

(10) Agreement between Australia and the Federation of Rhodesia and Nyasaland concerning
the mutual exchange of money orders, signed 6th December, 1962.

(11) Exchange of Notes dated 9th January, 1963 and l th February, 1963, between Australia
and the United States of America constituting an Agreement for the amendment of the
Agreement of 26th February, 1960, relating to Space Vehicle Tracking and Communi-
cations.

(12) Agreement between Australia and India with respect to the Mutual Protection of Priority
of Patents for Inventions, signed 23rd January, 1963.

(13) Exchange of Notes dated 24th January, 1963, between Australia and the United Kingdom,
constituting an Agreement for the amendment of the Schedule of the Air Services
Agreement of 7th February, 1958.

The following Papers were presented, pursuant to Statute--
Lands Acquisition Act-Land acquired for Civil Aviation purposes-Longreach, Queensland.
Seat of Government (Administration) Act-Ordinance-1963-No. 1-Poisons and Dangerous

Drugs.

5. DIscusSION OF MATTER OF URGENCY-POLITICAL CENSORSHIP.-Mr. Speaker informed the House that
Mr. A. D. Fraser had proposed that a definite matter of urgent public importance be submitted to
the House for discussion, namely, " This Government's exercise of political censorship as in the ban
on the Bidault television interview".

The proposed discussion having received the necessary support-
Mr. Fraser addressed the House.
Discussion ensued.
Discussion concluded.

6. GENERAL BUSINESS.-It being past fifteen minutes to one o'clock p.m., General Business was not called on.

7. AUSTRALIAN NATIONAL UNIVERSITY BILL 1963.-Sir Robert Menzies (Prime Minister) moved, pursuant
to notice, That he have leave to bring in a Bill for an Act relating to the Australian National University.

Question-put and passed.
Bill brought up, and read a first time.
Sir Robert Menzies moved, by leave, That the Bill be now read a second time.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Beazley), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the

next sitting.

8. COPYRIGHT BILL 1963.-Sir Garfield Barwick (Attorney-General) moved, pursuant to notice, That he
have leave to bring in a Bill for an Act to amend the Copyright Act 1912-1950.

Question-put and passed.
Bill brought up, and read a first time.
Sir Garfield Barwick moved, by leave, That the Bill be now read a second time.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Whitlam), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the

next sitting.

9. SERVICE AND EXECUTION OF PROCESS BILL 1963.-Sir Garfield Barwick (Attorney-General) moved, pursuant
to notice, That he have leave to bring in a Bill for an Act to amend the Service and Execution of Process
Act 1901-1958.

Question-put and passed.
Bill brought up, and read a first time.
Sir Garfield Barwick moved, by leave, That the Bill be now read a second time.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Whitlam), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the

next sitting.

10. WOOL TAX ASSESSMENT BILL 1963.-Mr. Adermann (Minister for Primary Industry) moved, pursuant
to notice, That he have leave to bring in a Bill for an Act to amend section thirteen of the Wool Tax
Assessment Act 1936-1962.

Question-put and passed.
Bill brought up, and read a first time.
Mr. Adermann moved, by leave, That the Bill be now read a second time.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Whitlam), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the

next sitting.



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 385

28th March, 1963.

11. WAYS AND MEANS-WOOL TAx.-The House, according to Order, resolved itself into the Committee of
Ways and Means.

(In the Committee.)

Mr. Adermann (Minister for Primary Industry) moved-
1. That, notwithstanding section seven of the Wool Tax Act (No. 1) 1957-1962 and any regulations

made under that section, the rates set out in the Third Schedule to that Act be deemed to have been and
be the rates prescribed for the purposes of paragraph (a) of sub-section (1.) of section six of that Act in
relation to-

(a) wool received by a wool-broker (not being wool previously received by a wool-broker
or dealer) on or after the twenty-eighth day of August, One thousand nine hundred
and sixty-one, and before the first day of July, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-
four, other than wool that-

(i) is received after the thirty-first day of March, One thousand nine hundred and
sixty-four; and

(ii) is not sold by the wool-broker before the first day of July, One thousand nine
hundred and sixty-four; and

(b) wool received by a dealer (not being wool previously received by a wool-broker or dealer)
on or after the twenty-eighth day of August, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-one,
and before the first day of July, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-four.

2. That, notwithstanding section seven of the Wool Tax Act (No. 2) 1957-1962 and any regulations
made under that section, the rates set out in the Third Schedule to that Act be deemed to have been and
be the rates prescribed for the purposes of paragraph (a) of sub-section (1.) of section six of that Act in
respect of wool to which that Act applies exported from Australia on or after the twenty-eighth day of
August, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-one, and before the first day of July, One thousand nine
hundred and sixty-four.

Question-put and passed.
Resolution to be reported, and leave asked to sit again.

The House resumed; Mr. Lucock reported accordingly.
Ordered-That the House will, at a later hour this day, again resolve itself into the said Committee.
Mr. Adermann moved, pursuant to contingent notice, That so much of the Standing Orders be suspended

as would prevent the remaining stages being passed without delay.
Question-put and passed.
On the motion of Mr. Adermann, the Resolution reported from the Committee was adopted by the House.
Ordered-That Mr. Adermann and Mr. Cramer do prepare and bring in Bills to carry out the foregoing

Resolution.

12. WOOL TAX BILL (No. 1) 1963.-Mr. Adermann (Minister for Primary Industry) then brought up a Bill
intituled A Bill for an Act relating to the Tax imposed by the " Wool Tax Act (No. 1) 1957-1962 ".

Bill read a first time.
Mr. Adermann moved, That the Bill be now read a second time.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Whitlam), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the

next sitting.

13. WOOL TAX BILL (No. 2) 1963.-Mr. Adermann (Minister for Primary Industry) also brought up a Bill
intituled A Bill for an Act relating to the Tax imposed by the " Wool Tax Act (No. 2) 1957-1962"

Bill read a first time.
Mr. Adermann moved, That the Bill be now read a second time.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Whitlam), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the

next sitting.

14. WAYS AND MEANS-CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENTS (Nos. 58 TO 71), CUSTOMS TARIFF(CANADA PREFERENCE)
AMENDMENTS (Nos. 6 TO 8) AND CUSTOMS TARIFF (NEW ZEALAND PREFERENCE) AMENDMENTS (Nos.
12 AND 13).-The House, according to Order, again resolved itself into the Committee of Ways and
Means.

(In the Committee.)

Mr. Fairhall (Minister representing the Minister for Customs and Excise) moved-

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 58).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-
first day of December, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-two, and that Duties of Customs
be collected accordingly.



386 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals " mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.
136. By omitting the two paragraphs numbered (2) of sub-item (F)

and inserting in their stead the following paragraphs:-
"(2) Tinned - - - - ad val.

and a deferred duty as follows:-
on and after 1st January, 1966

(2) Tinned - per ton
By omitting the two sub-items lettered (J) and inserting in

their stead the following sub-items:-
" (J) Plate and sheet, tinned, not further manufactured than

plated polished or decorated - - ad val.
and a deferred duty as follows:-

on and after 1st January, 1966
(j) Plate and sheet, tinned, not further manufactured than

plated polished or decorated - - per ton

Free

£2 17s.

Free

£2 17s.

71 per cent.

£5 15s.

7j per cent.

£5 15s.

7t per cent.

£5 15s."

7+ per cent.

£5 15s."

DIVISION XIV.-VEHICLES.
359. By omitting paragraph (5) of sub-item (D).

By omitting sub-item (G).

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.
460. By omitting from paragraph (4) of sub-item (c) the words

and figures " not covered by paragraph (2) or (3) "
and inserting in their stead the words, figures and
letter " not covered by paragraph (2) or (3) (a) ".

464. By omitting from sub-paragraph (d) of paragraph (1) of
sub-item (c) the words, figures and letter " Weighing
less than 4 ounces per square yard, otherwise covered
by paragraph (4) (b)-" and inserting in their stead
the words, figures and letter " Weighing not less than
3.5 ounces per square yard and less than 4 ounces per
square yard, otherwise covered by paragraph
(4) (b)-".

By omitting sub-paragraph (e) of paragraph (2) of sub-item
(c) and inserting in its stead the following sub-
paragraphs:-

"(e) Bed ticking containing man-made fibres and, if
containing wool, containing less than 20 per cent. by
weight of wool calculated on the textile fibre content

per square yard
(f) Bookbinders' cloth n.e.i. - - - ad val.

By inserting in sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (4) of
sub-item (c) after the words " pillow cases," the words
and figures " weighing not less than 3.5 ounces per square
yard, ".

471. By omitting sub-item (B) and inserting in its stead the
following sub-item:-

" (B) Other - - - - - ad val.

475. By omitting the words " not being floor coverings or plastic
sheets reinforced or sandwiched with textile fabrics-"
and inserting in their stead the words and figures " not
covered by item 471 and not being floor coverings-".

4d. 9d.
74 per cent. 7 per cent."

20 per cent. 20 per cent. 25 per cent."



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 387
28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

BTariff ri. Pref il Intermediate GeneralTariff Items. refe ia Tariff. Tariff.
Tariff.

Division XVI.-Miscellaneous-continued.

476. By omitting the words " not being floor coverings-" and
inserting in their stead the words and figures " not covered
by item 471 and not being floor coverings-".

478. By omitting the words and figures " in widths not exceeding
30 centimetres-" and inserting in their stead the words
and figures " in widths not exceeding 30 centimetres, not
covered by item 471-".

479. By omitting the word and figures " 477 or 478-" and
inserting in their stead the word and figures "477, 478
or 481-".

By omitting sub-items (o) and (E) and inserting in their stead
the following sub-items:-

" () Laces and nets-
(1) For apparel - - - - ad val.
(2) Other, not containing wool or containing less

than 20 per cent. by weight of wool calculated
on the textile fibre content-

(a) Of or containing man-made fibres
per square yard

(b) Of silk or having a textile fibre content
in chief part by weight of silk, not
covered by sub-paragraph (a)

per square yard
(c) Of cotton or having a textile fibre

content in chief part by weight of
cotton, not covered by sub-paragraph
(a) or (b)-

(1) Printed dyed or coloured
per square yard

or ad val.
whichever rate returns the lower duty.

(2) Bleached, not printed dyed or
coloured per square yard

or ad val.
whichever rate returns the lower duty.

(3) Other per square yard
or ad val.

whichever rate returns the lower duty.
(d) Other - - - - ad val.

(E) Wholly of wool, not covered by sub-item (B) or (D) (I)
per square yard

and ad val.
(F) Other - - - - - per lb.

or ad val.
whichever rate returns the higher duty."

482. By omitting the words and figures "Textile goods, viz.:-
narrow woven fabrics and narrow fabrics (Bolduc)
consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive, of a width not exceeding 30 centimetres, with
woven or false selvedges, including such fabrics" and
inserting in their stead the words and figures "Textile
goods, viz.:-narrow woven fabrics of a width not
exceeding 30 centimetres, with woven or false selvedges
or in tubular form and narrow fabrics (Bolduc) consisting
of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive,
including bias binding with folded edges and such fabrics".

By omitting from sub-item (A) the words " Seamless tubular
fabrics-" and inserting in their stead the words " Seam-
less tubular woven fabrics-".

By omitting from sub-item (B) the word " Other-" and
inserting in its stead the words " Other narrow woven
fabrics including bias binding-".

By omitting paragraph (2) of sub-item (B).
By adding after sub-item (a) a new sub-item as follows:-

" (c) Other (i.e. weftless fabrics) - - - ad val.

485. By omitting from paragraph (2) of sub-item (B) the words
" wholly or containing " and inserting in their stead the
words " of or containing ".

5 per cent.

1Id.

31d.

Id.
5 per cent.

id.
5 per cent.

Id.
5 per cent.

5 per cent.

6d.
174 per cent.

Is. 3d.
171 per cent.

17+ per cent. 35 per cent.

4d.

8d.

2d.

Id.

id.

221 per cent.

6d.
40 per cent.

3s.
30 per cent.

9d.

10d.

31d.

3d.

21d.

221 per cent.

6d.
47J per cent.

4s.
47} per cent.

10 per cent. 20 per cent. 25 per cent."



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 59).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-
first day of December, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-two, and that Duties of Customs
be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and
6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

THE CUSTOMS TARIFF.

By omitting Prefatory Note (15) and inserting in its stead the following Prefatory Note:-

"(15) Unless the Tariff otherwise provides or the Minister otherwise directs, composite
machines consisting of two or more machines fitted together to form a whole
and other machines adapted for the purpose of performing two or more
complementary or alternative functions are to be classified as if consisting
only of that component or as being that machine which performs the
principal function.".

IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.

160. By omitting from sub-item (A) the words "; chaffcutter
knives ".

165. By inserting after sub-item (B) new sub-items as follows:-
"(c) Strippers (agricultural machines) - - ad val.

each
(D) Metal parts (other than knife sections and ledger plates)

for reaper threshers, stripper harvesters, strippers
(agricultural machines), and harvesters n.e.i. - ad val.

per lb.

166. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 166. Machinery, machines and appliances:-
(A) Hay rakes, horse - - - ad val.

or each
whichever rate returns the higher duty.

(B) Reapers and binders - - ad val.
or each

whichever rate returns the higher duty.
(c) Mowers - - - - ad val.

or each
whichever rate returns the higher duty.

(D) Metal parts n.e.i., for reapers and binders,
hay rakes (horse) and mowers - ad val.

or per lb.
whichever rate returns the higher duty."

167. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 167. (A) (1) Clothes washing machines for household use,
electrically or power driven - each

or ad val.
whichever rate returns the higher duty.

(2) Clothes washing machines n.e.i. and mangles,
for household use - - - ad val.

(8) Clothes wringers for household use - ad val.

169. By omitting paragraph (5) of sub-item (A) and inserting in its
stead the following paragraph:-

" (5) Machinery used exclusively for and in the actual process
of electrotyping and stereotyping, not including goods
covered by item 172 - - - ad val.

171. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 171. Rolling mills and rolls and parts and accessories,
n.e.i. therefor-

(A) Mills - - - - ad val.
(B) Rolls - - - - ad val.
(c) Parts and accessories, n.e.i. - - ad val.

5 per cent.

5 per cent.

10 per cent.

10 per cent.

10 per cent.

£8

2d.

40 per cent.
£3

40 per cent.
£10

40 per cent.
£4

40 per cent.
£3

40 per cent.
£10

40 per cent.
£4

40 per cent.
2d.

10 per cent. 40 per cent.
S. 2d.

£3 £5 £6
221 per cent. 371 per cent. 471 per cent.

10 per cent. 25 per cent. 25 per cent.
22+ per cent. 40 per cent. 45 per cent."

7 per cent.

7+ per cent.
7j per cent.
71 per cent.

71 per cent."

71 per cent.
71 per cent.
7+ per cent,"



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 389
28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

Tariffms. Prtial Intermediate GeneralTariff Items. Preferential Tariff. Tariff.Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

Division VI.-Metals and Machinery-continued.

172. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 172. Machine tools for working metals or metallic carbides,
not being mechanically powered hand tools or gas-
operated welding brazing cutting or surface temper-
ing appliances-

(A) (1) Including parts and accessories therefor,
provided suitably equivalent goods the
manufacture of Australia are not
reasonably available, as prescribed by
Departmental By-laws - ad val.

(2) Including parts and accessories therefor,
provided suitably equivalent goods the
manufacture of Australia and the
United Kingdom are not reasonably
available, as prescribed by Depart-
mental By-laws - -

(B) (1) Boring machines; reaming machines-
(a) Reborers for the repair of internal

combustion engines and parts
of such engines - ad val.

(b) Vertical borers, single spindle,
length of stroke not exceeding
10 inches - - ad val.

(c) Horizontal borers, single ended,
whether fitted or arranged for
use with single or multiple
heads, having a stroke not
exceeding 12 inches - ad val.

(d) Other boring machines - ad val.
(e) Reaming machines - ad val.

(2) Drilling machines-
(a) Bench or pedestal types, drilling

capacity not exceeding 21
inches in mild steel - ad val.

(b) Radial, radius of swing not
exceeding 6 feet - ad val.

(c) Twin opposed horizontal, having
a drilling capacity in mild steel
not exceeding I inch diameter
and in addition having a
distance between chucks not
exceeding 36 inches - ad val.

(d) Vertical, with or arranged for use
with multiple spindle heads,
not covered by sub-paragraph
(a) - - - ad val.

(e) Other - - - ad val.
(3) Grinding honing lapping or polishing

machines-
(a) Automatic polishing - ad val.
(b) Honing machines designed to use

honing stones - ad val.
(c) Lapping machines designed to

lap with soft metal charged
with abrasives or with stone
laps - - - ad val.

(d) Grinding machines designed
solely or principally for pre-
paring or working printing
blocks plates or cylinders

ad val.
(e) Other - - - ad val.

(4) Milling machines-
(a) General purpose toolroom, not

usable with tables exceeding
40 inches in length or with
tables exceeding 15 inches in
width - - ad val.

(b) Pantograph type, with work capa-
city not exceeding 16 inches in
length and not exceeding 8
inches in width - ad val.

(c) Other - - - ad val.
(5) Hobbing machines - - ad val.

(c) (1) Sawing or filing machines-
(a) Hack sawing, single blade

ad val.

(b) Band sawing - ad val.
(c) Filing - - ad val.
(d) Abrasive cutting off type, dia-

meter of cutting wheel not
exceeding 24 inches - ad val.

(e) Other - - ad val.

Free

Free

27+ per cent.

71 per cent.

Free

40 per cent.

71 per cent.

Free

50 per cent.

27+ per cent. 40 per cent. 50 per cent.

27+ per cent.
Free
Free

40 per cent.
71 per cent.
7+ per cent.

27f per cent. 40 per cent.

27 per cent. 40 per cent.

27- per cent. 40 per cent.

50 per cent.
71 per cent.
71 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.
71 per cent.

71 per cent.

71 per cent.

7+ per cent.

27+ per cent. 40 per cent.
Free 7+ per cent.

71 per cent.

7+ per cent.

7+ per cent.

Free 7j per cent. 71 per cent.
27+ per cent. 40 per cent. 50 per cent.

271 per cent. 40 per cent.

271 per cent.
Free
Free

271 per cent.
271 per cent.
27+ per cent.

27+ per cent.
Free

40 per cent.
7+ per cent.
7+ per cent.

40 per cent.
40 per cent.
40 per cent.

40 per cent.
71 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.
7+ per cent.
71 per cent.

50 per cent.
50 per cent.
50 per cent.

50 per cent.
71 per cent.



390 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.
28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTmES-continued.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

Division VI.-Metals and Machinery-continued.
172.-continued.

"172.-continued.
(c)-continued.

(2) Shaping slotting shaving or planing
machines, removing metal with a cutting
tool, not covered by sub-item (B)-

(a) Shaping, with stroke not exceed-
ing 28 inches; slotting, with
stroke not exceeding 8 inches

ad val.
(b) Other - - ad val.

(3) Lathes and chucking machines and turn-
ing machines, with horizontal beds, not
covered by paragraph (4)-

(a) Capstan, with heights of centres
above bed not exceeding 10
inches - - ad val.

(b) Brake drum, with capacity not
exceeding 26 inches diameter
of drums - - ad val.

(c) T-bed surfacing and boring
ad val.

(d) General purpose, of the sliding
surfacing and screw cutting
(or chasing) type, with or
without tail stocks, including
any modifications from such
basic lathes, but not including
automatic or semi-automatic
machines - - ad val.

(e) Other - - ad val.
(4) Spinning lathes-

(a) Heights of centres above bed not
exceeding 20 inches - ad val.

(b) Other - - ad val.
(5) Forging hammering riveting bending

straightening pressing or drawing
machines, not covered by sub-item
(c) (2)-

(a) Riveting, pneumatic-
(1) Single shot or rotary

spinning, stroke not
exceeding 2 inches

ad val.
(2) Reciprocating or rotary

and reciprocating,
having a capacity not
exceeding * inch
diameter of cold mild
steel rivets - ad val.

(3) Other - - ad val.
(b) Riveting, non-pneumatic-

(1) Rotary spinning, stroke
not exceeding 2
inches - ad val.

(2) Other - - ad val.
(c) Presses, forming, including such

machines which form and cut;
bending curving straighten-
ing grooving edging or
seaming machines for working
sheet metal (irrespective of
gauge); drop forging ham-
mers other than hydraulic, not
exceeding 40 cwt. capacity-

(1) Designed solely or prin-
cipally for preparing
or working printing
blocks plates or
cylinders - ad val.

(2) Other - - ad val.
(d) Other - - - ad val.

(6) Cutting shearing slitting or nibbling
machines, not covered by paragraph
(5)-

(a) Guillotine shears; cutting presses
ad val.

(b) Slitting, designed for cutting or
trimming mild steel not
exceeding 10 gauge (B.G.) in
thickness to circles or shapes
not exceeding 60 inches in
any direction, whether or not
also capable of flanging the
cut shapes - ad val.

27J per cent. 40 per cent.
Free 71 percent.

50 per cent.
71 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.

271 per cent. 40 per cent.

271 per cent.

271 per cent.

40 per cent.

40 per cent.

271 per cent. 40 per cent. 50 per cent.
Free 71 per cent. 74 per cent.

274 per cent. 40 per cent.
Free 71 per cent.

50 per cent.
74 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.
71 per cent.

274 per cent. 40 per cent.

27 per cent. 40 per cent.
Free 7 per cent.

274 per cent. 40 per cent. 50 per cent.
Free 71 per cent. 7 per cent.

Free 71 per cent.
271 per cent. 40 per cent.

Free 74 per cent.

74 per cent.
50 per cent.
74 per cent.

50 per cent.271 per cent. 40 per cent.

271 per cent. I 40 per cent. 50 per cent,



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 391
28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

Tariff Items.
British

Preferential
Tariff.

Intermediate
Tariff.

General
Tariff.

Division VI.-Metals and Machinery-continued.
172.-continued.

" 172.-continued.
(c)-continued.

(6)-continued
(c) Slitting, gang, designed for cutting

mild steel sheets not exceeding
40 inches in width and of a
thickness not exceeding 12
gauge (B.G.) - ad val.

(d) Other - - - ad val.
(7) Screwing chasing or tapping machines, not

being lathes-
(a) Screwing or chasing (external

cut)-
(1) Radial die types not

exceeding 4 inches
capacity in mild steel

ad val.
(2) Tangential die types not

exceeding 8 inches
capacity in mild steel

ad val.
(b) Tapping, not exceeding + inch

diameter in mild steel ad val.
(c) Other - - - ad val.

(D) Other machines-
(1) Powered heads, suitable for drilling

milling boring reaming tapping
or other rotary cutting functions

ad val.
(2) Jewellers' rolls, hand operated, up to

15 inches length of roll - ad val.
(3) Other - - - ad val.

173. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 173. Accessories (not being interchangeable tools) and
parts suitable for use solely or principally with
machine tools for working metals or metallic car-
bides-

(A) (1) Copying attachments for lathes - ad val.
(2) Dividing heads with spiral cuttingdevices;

indexing tables - - - ad val.
(3) Lathe tool holders - - ad val.
(4) Chucks - - - - ad val.
(5) Vises-

(a) Cast iron - - ad val.
(b) Other - - - ad val.

(B) Parts n.e.i. forming part of the contour of the
machine or being an internal part of the
machine-

(1) For machines covered by item 172
at rates of duty not exceeding 7+
per cent. ad valorem - ad val.

(2) Other - - - ad val.
(c) N.E.I. - - - - ad val.

174. By omitting paragraph (1) of sub-item (K).
By omitting sub-item (M) and inserting in its stead the

following sub-item:-
" (M) Metal-working machines and appliances, not being

mechanically powered hand tools, viz.:-
(1) Casting machines-

(a) Centrifugal - - - ad val.
(b) Die casting machines - ad val.
(c) Type-casting and finishing machines

ad val.
(2) Furnaces, rotary, and quenching tanks, rotary,

combined, for annealing and hardening
ad val.

(3) Measuring machines - - - ad val.
(4) Stripping machines, hydraulic - ad val.
(5) Testing machines-

(a) Gear - - - ad val.
(b) Spline shaft and cam shaft, combined

or separate - - ad val.
(6) Wire-tinning machines - - ad val.

By omitting sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (3) of sub-
item (w).

By omitting sub-paragraph (e) of paragraph (13) of sub-
item (w).

By inserting after paragraph (15) of sub-item (x) a new
paragraph as follows:-

"(16) Counting machines for counting by weight parts
produced by automatic machines - - ad val.

274 per cent. 40 per cent. 50 per cent.
Free 74 per cent. 7j per cent.

274 per cent. I 40 per cent.

27+ per cent.

274 per cent.
Free

27+ per cent.

27) per cent.
Free

Free

Free
Free
Free

20 per cent.
Free

Free
274 per cent.
274 per cent.

Free
Free

Free

Free
Free
Free

Free

Free
Free

Free

40 per cent.

40 per cent.
71 per cent.

40 per cent.

40 per cent.
71 per cent.

71 per cent.

71 per cent.
74 per cent.
74 per cent.

30 per cent.
74 per cent.

71 per cent.
40 per cent.
40 per cent.

7 per cent.
74 per cent.

74 per cent.

71 per cent.
71 per cent.
7j per cent.

71 per cent.

74 per cent.
71 per cent.

74 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.
74 per cent.

50 per cent.

50 per cent.
74 per cent."

74 per cent.

74 per cent.
71 per cent.
71 per cent.

40 per cent.
71 per cent.

71 per cent.
50 per cent.
50 per cent."

71 per cent.
74 per cent.

74 per cent.

71 per cent.
7 per cent.
74 per cent.

74 per cent.

74 per cent.
74 per cent."

71 per cent."



392 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

Tariff Items.
British

Preferential
Tariff.

Intermediate
Tariff.

General
Tariff.

Division VI.-Metals and Machinery-continued.
174.-continued.

By omitting paragraph (41) of sub-item (x) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(41) Clippers, tube, for fastening clips to collapsible
tubes - - - - ad val.

By omitting paragraph (52) of sub-item (x) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

" (52) Packing machines, nail, electro-magnetic - ad val.

By omitting paragraph (78) of sub-item (x) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(78) Blowing machines, core, air operated - ad val.

By omitting paragraph (79) of sub-item (x).

By omitting paragraph (85) of sub-item (x).

175. By omitting sub-items (D) and (E) and inserting in their
stead the following sub-item:-

"(D) (1) Weighing machines n.e.i., including computing
weighing machines; weighbridges; scales and
balances, n.e.i., including computing scales and
balances; chemists' counter scales; spring
balances and steelyards; weights n.e.i.; com-
bined bagging weighing and sewing machines

ad val.
(2) Balances, sensitive to I gram or less, including

weights therefor - - - ad val.

176. By omitting paragraphs (2), (3) and (4) of sub-item (c).
By inserting after paragraph (1) of sub-item (F) a new para-

graph as follows:-
" (2) Interchangeable tools for hand tools, for machine tools

or for power-operated hand tools-
(a) (1) Twist drills of types designed solely or

principally for use with machine tools
for working metals or metallic carbides

ad val.
(2) Files, rotary, metal-working - ad val.

(b) Screwing tools, viz.:-Dies taps and chasers-
(1) Collapsible machine taps for working

metals or metallic carbides - ad val.
(2) Other - - - - ad val.

(c) Wholly or partly of cemented carbides of types
usable with machines, not covered by sub-
paragraph (a) or (b)-

(1) Bits for rotary and percussive rock
drills - - - ad val.

(2) Rod and wire drawing dies; bolt and
screw heading dies - ad val.

(3) N.E.I., for working metals or metallic
carbides - - - ad val.

(4) N.E.I., other - ad val.
(d) Designed solely or principally for working

materials other than metals or metallic
carbides, not covered by sub-paragraph
(c) and not being designed solely or prin-
cipally for use with non-mechanical hand
tools-

(1) Wood-working, viz.:-bits, boring or
drilling; mortice chains, links and
guide bars, and combined hollow
chisels and augers, for use on
morticing machines - ad val.

(2) For diamond drilling machines and
rotary and percussive rock drills

ad val.
(3) For coal cutting machines - ad val.
(4) For rock boring machines n.e.i.

ad val.
(5) N.E.I. - - - ad val.

(e) Designed solely or principally for use with
non-mechanical hand tools, not including
knives and cutting blades, n.e.i. - ad val.

(f) N.E.I, - ad val.

Free

Free

Free

17+ per cent.

Free

7+ per cent. 7+ per cent."

7+ per cent.

71 per cent.

32+ per cent.

74 per cent.

71 per cent."

7+ per cent."

40 per cent.

71 per cent."

50 per cent.
50 per cent.

121 per cent. 40 per cent.
27+ per cent. 40 per cent.

271 per cent. 40 per cent. 50 per cent.
30 per cent. 40 per cent. 52+ per cent.

Free

Free

271 per cent.
171 per cent.

Free

Free
Free

7+ per cent.
27+ per cent.

27+ per cent.
27+ per cent.

71 per cent.

7+ per cent.

40 per cent.
321 per cent.

71 per cent.

71 per cent.
7+ per cent.

20 per cent.
55 per cent.

7f per cent.

7+ per cent.

50 per cent.
35 per cent.

7j per cent.

7+ per cent.
7+ per cent.

30 per cent.
57+ per cent.

35 per cent. 47+ per cent.
40 per cent. 50 per cent,"



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 393

28th March, 1963.

THE ScHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

British Intermediate General
Tariff Items. Preferential Tariff. Tariff.Tariff.

Division VI.-Metals and Machinery-continued.

176.-continued.
By omitting paragraphs (3) and (4) of sub-item (F) and in-

serting in their stead the following paragraphs:-
"(3) Knives and cutting blades for machines or for mecha-

nical appliances-
(a) Designed solely or principally for use with

machine tools for working metals or metallic
carbides - - - - ad val.

(b) Wholly or partly of cemented carbides, not
covered by sub-paragraph (a) - ad val.

(c) For incorporation in agricultural machines, not
covered by sub-paragraph (b)-

(1) Knife sections and ledger plates for
incorporation in the cutting
mechanism of agricultural field
machines; chaffcutter knives

ad val.
(2) For reapers and binders or for field

mowers - - - ad val.
or per lb.

whichever rate returns the higher duty.
(3) For reaper threshers, stripper har-

vesters, strippers, or harvesters
n.e.i. - - - ad val.

per lb.
(d) Knives, band, for leather splitting machines,

not covered by sub-paragraph (b) - ad val.
(e) Knives, cylindrical, for coir mat clipping and

shearing machines, not covered by sub-
paragraph (b) - ad val.

(f) N.E.I. - ad val.
(4) Parts and accessories wholly or partly of cemented

carbides for machines, but not including-
goods covered by paragraph (2) or (3) or by item

173
goods otherwise specifically provided for at higher

rates of duty than this paragraph - ad val.

By inserting after sub-item (T) a new sub-item as follows:-
" (u) Bleaching and dyeing machinery, textile, combined or

separate, and spindles and tubes of stainless steel
therefor - ad val.

219. By omitting sub-item (A) and inserting in its stead the
following sub-item:-

"(A) Screwplates; stocks for dies; tap wrenches - ad val.

27+ per cent.

17+ per cent.

Free

10 per cent.

5 per cent.

Free

Free
27+ per cent.

40 per cent.

321 per cent.

7+ per cent.

40 per cent.
2d.

2d.

71 per cent.

50 per cent.

35 per cent.

71 per cent.

40 per cent.
2d.

2d.

71 per cent.

7} per cent. 7+ per cent.
55 per cent. 57+ per cent.

17+ per cent. 32+ per cent. 35 per cent."

27f per cent.

30 per cent.

50 per cent.

40 per cent.

57+ per cent."

521 per cent."

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.

375. By inserting after sub-item (c) a new sub-item as follows:-
" (D) Pistols, metallizing - - - ad val. Free 71 per cent. 7+ per cent."

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 60).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-

fifth day of January, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs

be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff

Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.



394 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate Genera

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.
460. By omitting from sub-paragraph (c) of paragraph (3) of

sub-item (c) the word and figure " or (5) " and inserting
in their stead the word and figures ", (5) or (6) ".

By omitting paragraph (5) of sub-item (c) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraphs:-

" (5) Weighing not more than 18 ounces per square yard, not
covered by paragraph (1), (2), (3) or (4)

per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. 1+d.
(6) Other-

(a) For use otherwise than in the manufacture of
impregnated coated or laminated transmission
conveyor or elevator belts or belting

per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. l+d.
(b) Other - per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. 1+d.

and, in addition, a temporary duty of - ad val. 20 per cent. 20 per cent. 20 per cent.
provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 17th December,
1962 which are entered for home consumption
on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

464. By omitting from sub-paragraph (g) of paragraph (1) of
sub-item (c) the word, figure and letter " paragraph
(6) (b)" and inserting in their stead the words, figures and
letters " paragraph (6) (b) or (7) (c) ".

By omitting from paragraph (6) of sub-item (c) the word and
figures " (3) or (5) " and inserting in their stead the word
and figures " (3), (5) or (7) ".

By omitting from sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (6) of
sub-item (c) the words and figures ", weighing less than
18 ounces per square yard ".

By inserting after paragraph (6) of sub-item (c) a new
paragraph as follows:-

"(7) Weighing more than 18 ounces per square yard, not
covered by paragraph (2) or (3)-

(a) Furnishing fabrics, not printed-
(1) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by

weight of man-made fibres calculated
on the textile fibre content - ad val. 50 per cent. 50 per cent. 60 per cent.

less per square yard 2+d.
or per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. 1+d.

whichever rate returns the higher duty.
(2) Other - - ad val. 37+ per cent. 50 per cent. 60 per cent.

(b) With raised nap on one or both sides, suitable
for human apparel per square yard id. lid. 3+d.

or ad val. 5 per cent.
whichever rate returns the lower duty.

(c) Other-
(1) For use otherwise than in the manufac-

ture of impregnated coated or
laminated transmission conveyor or
elevator belts or belting - per lb. 2s. 2s. 6d. 2s. 6d.

and ad val. 7+ per cent. 17+ per cent. 17+ per cent.
(2) Other - - per lb. 2s. 2s. 6d. 2s. 6d.

and ad val. 7+ per cent. 17 per cent. 171 per cent.
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

ad val. 20 per cent. 20 per cent. 20 per cent.
provided that, in respect of such
goods in direct transit to Australia on
17th December, 1962 which are
entered for home consumption on
arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

465. By omitting from sub-paragraph (c) of paragraph (3) of
sub-item (c) the word and figure " or (5) " and inserting
in their stead the word and figures ", (5) or (6) ".

By omitting paragraph (5) of sub-item (c) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraphs:-

"(5) Weighing not more than 18 ounces per square yard,
not covered by paragraph (1), (2), (3) or (4)

per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. 1+d.
(6) Other-

(a) For use otherwise than in the manufacture of
impregnated coated or laminated transmission
conveyor or elevator belts or belting

per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. 1+d.
(b) Other - - per square yard 2s. 6d. 2s. 8+d. 3s. l+d.

and, in addition, a temporary duty of - ad val. 20 per cent. 20 per cent. 20 per cent.
provided that, in respect of such goods in direct
transit to Australia on 17th December, 1962
which are entered for home consumption on
arrival, no temporary duty shall be payable."



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 39!
28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 61).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the fifth
day of February, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs
be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, "Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British Intermediate General
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.

169. By omitting sub-item (E) and inserting in its stead the follow-
ing sub-item:-

"(E) Taximeters, and parts n.e.i. therefor-
(1) Taximeters, complete or substantially com-

plete - - - - ad val. 25 per cent.
o each £15

or less ad val. 10 per cent.
whichever rate returns the higher duty.

(2) Other - - - - ad val. 25 per cent.

35 per cent.
£15

35 per cent.

35 per cent.
£15

35 per cent."

176. By omitting sub-item (A) and inserting in its stead I
ing sub-item:-

"(A) Ball or roller bearings, not being roller-bearij
bearing plummer or hanger blocks-

(1) Tapered roller bearings
(2) Other

179. By omitting sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (1) o
(G) and inserting in its stead the following
graph:-

"(b) Motor vehicle types-
(1) 6 volt or 12 volt rating
(2) Other -

By omitting sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (2) o
(G) and inserting in its stead the follow
paragraph:-

" (b) Motor vehicle types-
(1) 6 volt or 12 volt rating
(2) Other

By omitting sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (3) ol
(G) and inserting in its stead the follow
paragraph:-

" (a) Starting motors for internal combustio
engines-

(1) 6 volt or 12 volt rating
(2) Other

By omitting sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (4) of
(G) and inserting in its stead the follow
paragraph:-

"(a) Starting motors for internal combustiol
engines-

(1) 6 volt or 12 volt rating
(2) Other

By omitting sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (1) of
(H) and inserting in its stead the follow
paragraph:-

" (a) For 6 volt or 12 volt systems -

By inserting after sub-item (M) new sub-items as fi
"(N) Distributors for internal combustion piston

motor vehicle type for 6 volt or 12 volt s)

(o) Distributors for internal combustion piston
other

per cent. 25 per cent. 25 per cent.
Free 121 per cent. 121 per cent."

45 per cent. 521 per cent. 60 per cent.
27+ per cent. 45 per cent. 571 per cent."

- ad val. 45 per cent. 521 per cent. 60 per cent.
- ad val. 271 per cent. 45 per cent. 571 per cent."

- ad val. 45 per cent. 52J per cent. 60 per cent.
- ad val. 27J per cent. 45 per cent. 571 per cent."

- ad val. 45 per cent. 521 per cent. 60 per cent.
- ad val. 271 per cent. 45 per cent. 571 per cent."

45 per cent. 521 per cent. 60 per cent."

45 per cent.

Free

521 per cent.

71 per cent.

60 per cent.

74 per cent."



396 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

Tariff Items.
British

Preferential Intermediate General
Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION IX.-DRUGS AND CHEMICALS.

280. By inserting after sub-item (T) a new sub-item as follows:-
" (u) Styrene - - - - - ad val. 10 percent. 17 percent. 17 per cent."

DIVISION XIV.-VEHICLES.

359. By omitting from sub-item (D) the words, figures and
letters:-

" Vehicle components whether the Tariff otherwise provides
or not (excepting when imported separately, lamps
covered by item 181 (D) (1) (b) and commutators and
parts therefor and excepting the following components
whether imported separately or otherwise-"

and inserting in their stead the words, figures and letters:-
" Vehicle components whether the Tariff otherwise provides

or not (excepting when imported separately-
lamps covered by item 181 (D) (1) (b)
commutators and parts therefor
tapered roller bearings and parts therefor

and excepting the following components whether im-
ported separately or otherwise-".

By omitting sub-paragraphs (b), (c), (d) and (e) of paragraph
(1) of sub-item (D) and inserting in their stead the following
sub-paragraphs:-

"(b) Distributors - - - - - ad val.
(c) High tension ignition coils, 6 volt or 12 volt rating

ad val.
(d) Automatic voltage regulators for 6 volt or 12 volt

systems - - - - - ad val.
(e) (1) Generators, 6 volt or 12 volt rating - ad val.

(2) Starting motors, 6 volt or 12 volt rating - ad val.

By omitting sub-item (F) and inserting in its stead the follow-
ing sub-item:-

" (F) (1) High tension ignition coils, 6 volt or 12 volt rating
ad val.

(2) U-bolts; shackle bolts; front and rear lampware
for vehicles of the types covered by item 360 (D);
warning devices of the types used in vehicles
covered by item 360 (o); vehicle parts n.e.i.,
whether malleable iron castings or not - ad val.

45 per cent.

45 per cent.

45 per cent.
45 per cent.
45 per cent.

521 per cent.

521 per cent.

521 per cent.
521 per cent.
52+ per cent.

60 per cent.

60 per cent.

60 per cent.
60 per cent.
60 per cent."

27+ per cent. 37+ per cent. 37+ per cent.

274 per cent. 37+ per cent. 37+ per cent."

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.

368. By omitting sub-paragraphs (c), (d) and (e) of paragraph (1)
of sub-item (B) and inserting in their stead the following
sub-paragraphs:-

" (c) Solutions; emulsions and pastes, not covered by sub-
paragraph (b) - - - - ad val.

(d) Other- - - - - - per lb.
and ad val.

7+ per cent. 20 per cent. 20 per cent.
7d. 7d. 7d.

7j per cent. 7+ per cent."

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 62).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the eleventh
day of February, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs
be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and
6th December, 1962.



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

Tariff Items.
British

Preferential
Tariff.

Intermediate General
Tariff. Tariff.

I -- ~ - °l

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.
197. By omitting paragraph (2) of sub-item (A) and inserting in

its stead the following paragraph:-
" (2) Table dessert grill steak or barbecue knives, having

forged stainless steel blades incorporating " Water-
loo " type bolsters, the handle not being forged in one
piece with the blade - - - ad val. Free
and, in addition, temporary duties of - ad val. 27+ per cent.
provided that, in respect of such goods in direct transit
to Australia on 1 th January, 1963 which are entered
for home consumption on arrival, no temporary
duties shall be payable."

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.
368. By omitting clause (2) of sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (I)

of sub-item (D) and inserting in its stead the following
clause:-

" (2) Other - - - - - per lb. 7d.
less ad val. 10 per cent.

or ad val. 25 per cent.
whichever rate returns the higher duty

and, in addition, a temporary duty as follows:-
for each Id. or part thereof by which the F.O.B.

price is less than 24d. per lb. - - per lb. Id.
provided that, in respect of such goods in direct
transit to Australia on IIth January, 1963 which
are entered for home consumption on arrival, no
temporary duty shall be payable."

7j percent. 7} percent.
30 per cent. 30 per cent.

7d. 7d.

35 per cent. 35 per cent.

Id. Id.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 63).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the eleventh
day of February, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs
be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals " mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and
6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British Intermediate General
Tariff Items. Preferential Tariff. Tariff.

Tariff.

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.

464. By omitting paragraph (4) of sub-item (B) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(4) Other-
(a) Singles, including mercerised singles-

(1) Finer than count No. 60 - ad val.
(2) Finer than count No. 40 and not finer

than count No. 60 - ad val.
and, for each Id. or part thereof by
which the F.O.B. price is less than
85d. per lb., an additional duty of

per lb.
(3) Finer than count No. 20 and not finer

than count No. 40 - ad val.
and, for each Id. or part thereof by
which the F.O.B. price is less than
70d. per lb., an additional duty of

per lb.
(4) Other - - ad val.

and, for each Id. or part thereof by
which the F.O.B. price is less than
60d. per lb., an additional duty of

per lb.
(b) Folded, not including mercerised-

(I) Having each and every ply finer than
count No. 60 - - ad val.

(2) Other -- ad val.
and, for each Id. or part thereof by
which the F.O.B. price is less than
70d. per lb., an additional duty of

per lb.
(c) Folded, mercerised - - - ad val.

Free 71 per cent.

25 per cent. 374 per cent.

Id. Id.

25 per cent. 371 per cent.

71 per cent.

371 per cent.

Id.

371 per cent.

Id.
271 per cent.

Id.

Id. Id.
per cent. 27+ per cent.

Free 74 per cent. 71 per cent.
25 per cent. 371 per cent. 371 per cent.

Id.
20 per cent.

Id.
20 per cent."

--------- -----



398 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.
28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 64).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the first day
of March, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs be collected
accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, "Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.

139. By omitting paragraph (3) of sub-item (A) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(3) Waste and scrap - - - - ad val. Free 7- per cent. 7j per cent."

By omitting sub-item (B) and inserting in its stead the follow-
ing sub-item:-

" () Wrought bars rods angles shapes sections plates sheet
and strip, wire of solid section, tubes and pipes and
blanks therefor, hollow bars, not further manu-
factured than plated polished or decorated, but not
including goods covered by item 181 (a) - ad val. 15 per cent. 30 per cent. 30 per cent.
and, on the aluminium content, for each £1 of the
equalizing cost per ton (as determined by the Minister
from time to time for the purposes of this sub-item
as applicable at the date of exportation of the
goods) - - - - - per ton £1 £1 £1 "

By omitting sub-item (D) and inserting in its stead the follow-
ing sub-item:-

"(D) Stranded wire cables cordage ropes plaited bands and
the like, whether or not the strands have been plated
tinned or similarly treated, including such goods laid
on core of other materials or having external coverings
of textile plastic or other materials, but not including
goods covered by item 181 (B) - - ad val. 10 per cent. 35 per cent. 37- per cent.
and, on the aluminium content, for each £1 of the
equalizing cost per ton (as determined by the Minister
from time to time for the purposes of this sub-item
as applicable at the date of exportation of the
goods) - - per ton £1 £1 £1
with maximum of - - ad val. 35 per cent. 424 per cent. .. "



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 399

28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 65).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the first day
of March, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs be collected
accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December. 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.
IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediat aTariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION IV.-AGRICULTURAL PRODUCTS AND GROCERIES.

77. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 77. Non-defatted flours or meals of oil seeds or oleaginous
fruit covered by item 92, but not including mustard
flour or peanut butter-

(A) Soya bean flour - - per cental Free 3s. lid. 4s.
(a) Linseed flour or meal; safflower seed flour or

meal; soya bean meal - - Free Free Free
(c) Other - - - per cental Is. 6d. 2s. 2s."

92. By omitting sub-item (F).

DIVISION VII.--OILS, PAINTS, AND VARNISHES.

225. By inserting after sub-item (B) a new sub-item as follows:-
" (c) Organic surface-active agents, viz.:-

(1) Turkey red oil - - per gallon 6d. 8d. 8d.
(2) Sulphonated oils, other - per gallon 6d. 9d. 9d."

230. By inserting after clause (2) of sub-paragraph (b) of para-
graph (1) of sub-item (A) a new clause as follows:-

"(3) Soya bean, as prescribed by Departmental By-
laws - - - - per gallon Is. 8d. 2s. 2s."

By omitting paragraph (5) of sub-item (A) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

" (5) Linseed - per gallon 4s. 6d. 4s. 6d. 4s. 6d.
and, for each 3d. by which the F.O.B. price is less
than 10s. per gallon, an additional duty of - ad val. 2 per cent. 2 per cent. 2 per cent."

By omitting paragraph (7) of sub-item (A) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(7) Safflower per gallon Is. 10d. 2s. 2s."
By omitting sub-item (B) and inserting in its stead the

following sub-item:-
" (a) Animal and vegetable oils, boiled, oxidized, dehydrated,

sulphurized, blown or polymerized by heat in
vacuum or inert gas or otherwise modified, but not
including sulphonated oils-

(1) Linseed oil, boiled, oxidized, blown, poly-
merized, isomerized or containing added
driers - - per gallon 4s. 4d. 4s. 6d. 4s. 6d.
and, for each 3d. by which the F.O.B. price
is less than 10s. per gallon, an additional
duty of - - - - ad val. 2 per cent. 2 per cent. 2 per cent.

(2) Castor oil, dehydrated - per gallon 6id. Is. Is.
(3) Rape seed oil, blown - - - Free Free Free
(4) Of safflower seed oil base; of soya bean oil

base - - - per gallon Is. 10d. 2s. 2s.
(5) Vegetable paint oils not covered by paragraph

(1), (2), (3) or (4) - - per gallon Is. 4d. Is. 6d. Is. 6d.
(6) Other, including modified fish oils per gallon 6d. 9d. 9d."

Pa295/63-4



400 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.
28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 66).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the fourth
day of March, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs be
collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, "Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.
459. By omitting paragraph (4) of sub-item (c) and inserting in

its stead the following paragraph:-
"(4) Furnishing fabrics, not printed, weighing 6 ounces or

more per square yard, not covered by paragraph (2)-
(a) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight

of man-made fibres calculated on the textile
fibre content - - per square yard

r ad val.
r less per square yard

whichever rate returns the higher duty
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

(b) Other, not being wholly of silk - ad val.
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

460. By omitting paragraph (4) of sub-item (c) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(4) Furnishing fabrics, not printed, weighing 6 ounces or
more per square yard, not covered by paragraph (2)
or (3) (a) -- - per square yard

orf ad val.
]less per square yard

whichever rate returns the higher duty
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in direct
transit to Australia on 25th January, 1963 which are
entered for home consumption on arrival, no tem-
porary duty shall be payable."

463. By omitting paragraph (4) of sub-item (c) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(4) Furnishing fabrics, not printed, weighing 6 ounces or
more per square yard, not covered by paragraph (1)
or (3)-

(a) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight
of man-made fibres calculated on the textile
fibre content - - per square yard

orrf lad val.
o less per square yard

whichever rate returns the higher duty
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

- provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

2s. 2s.
12+ percent. 12 per cent.

37+ per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

50 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s.
12+ per cent.

60 per cent.

2s.
12+ per cent.

3s. ld.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
121 per cent. 121 per cent. 121 per cent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
121 per cent. 121 per cent. 121 per cent.



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 4(
28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate Gera

Tariff. Tariff.

Division XVI.-Miscellaneous-continued.
163.-continued.

" (4)-continued.
(b) Other, not being wholly of ramie - ad val.

and, in addition, a temporary duty of
per square yard

less, on the F.O.B. price
provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

464. By omitting sub-paragraph (c) of paragraph (5) of sub-item
(c) and inserting in its stead the following sub-para-
graph:-

" (c) Furnishing fabrics, not printed, weighing 6 ounces or
more per square yard-

(1) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight
of man-made fibres calculated on the textile
fibre content - - per square yard

of ad val.
o less per square yard

whichever rate returns the higher duty
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

(2) Other - ad val.
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

By omitting sub-paragraph (c) of paragraph (6) of sub-item
(c) and inserting in its stead the following sub-para-
graph:-

"(c) Furnishing fabrics, not printed-
(1) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight

of man-made fibres calculated on the textile
fibre content - - per square yard

Sad val.
less per square yard

whichever rate returns the higher duty
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

(2) Other - ad val.
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

By omitting sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (7) of sub-item
(c) and inserting in its stead the following sub-para-
graph:-

" (a) Furnishing fabrics, not printed-
(1) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight

of man-made fibres calculated on the textile
fibre content - - per square yard

orf ad val.
no less per square yard

whichever rate returns the higher duty
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

37+ percent. 50 per cent. 60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
121 per cent. : 12 per cent. 12 per cent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

2s.
121 per cent.

37+ per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s.
percent. 121 per cent.

50 per cent.

2s.
124 per cent.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

60 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
12 per cent. 124 per cent. 121 per cent.

374 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

50 per cent.

2s.
124 per cent.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

60 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
121 per cent. 121 per cent. 12 per cent.



402 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

Division XVI.-Miscellaneous-continued.
464.-continued.

"(a)-continued.
(2) Other - - - - ad val.

and, in addition, a temporary duty of
per square yard

less, on the F.O.B. price
provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

465. By omitting paragraph (4) of sub-item (c) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(4) Furnishing fabrics, not printed, weighing 6 ounces or
more per square yard, not covered by paragraph (2)
or (3) (a)-

per square yard
f ad val.

or less per square yard
whichever rate returns the higher duty

and, in addition, a temporary duty of
per square yard

less, on the F.O.B. price
provided that, in respect of such goods in direct
transit to Australia on 25th January, 1963 which are
entered for home consumption on arrival, no tem-
porary duty shall be payable."

472. By omitting sub-item (B) and inserting in its stead the follow-
ing sub-item:-

" () Moquettes weighing not less than 6 ounces per square
yard-

(1) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight
of man-made fibres calculated on the textile
fibre content and, if containing wool, con-
taining less than 20 per cent. by weight of
wool calculated on the textile fibre content

per square yard
f ad val.

or(less per square yard
whichever rate returns the higher duty

and, in addition, a temporary duty of
per square yard

less, on the F.O.B. price
provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

(2) Other - ad val.
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

per square yard
less, on the F.O.B. price

provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 25th January,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable."

371 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

50 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

60 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
121 per cent. 121 per cent. 121 percent.

2s. 6d.
50 per cent.

21d.

2s. 81d.
50 per cent.

3s. lid.
60 per cent.

2s. 2s. 2s.
121 per cent. 121 per cent. 121 per cent.

371 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

50 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.

671 per cent.

2s.
121 per cent.



VOTES AN4D PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 403
28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 67).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the eleventh
day of March, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs be
collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British Intermediate General
Tariff Items. Preferential Tariff. Tariff.

Tariff.

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.

175. By omitting paragraph (2) of sub-item (o) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

"(2) Shavers - - - - ad val. 20 per cent. 30 per cent.

197. By inserting after sub-item (D) a new sub-item as follows:-
"(E) (1) Cutting plates and heads suitable for electric dry

shavers - - - - - ad val. 20 per cent. 30 per cent.

40 per cent."

40 per cent."

DIVISION XI.-HIDES, LEATHER, AND RUBBER.

330. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following
item:-

" 330. Rubber including latex, natural and synthetic; silicone
rubber-

(A) Raw; reclaimed; waste-
(1) As prescribed by Departmental By-laws Free Free Free
(2) Polybutadiene styrene synthetic rubber,

not including reclaimed, waste or
latex - - - per lb. 3d. 3d. 3d.

(3) Other - - - - per lb. 2d. 2d. 2d.
provided that for liquid latex duty
shall be assessed on the rubber
content.

(B) Compounded-
(1) As prescribed by Departmental By-laws Free Free Free
(2) Polybutadiene styrene synthetic rubber

n.e.i., not including latex - per lb. 3d. 3d. 3d.
(3) N.E.I. - - - - per lb. 2d. 2d. 2d.

provided that for liquid latex duty
shall be assessed on the rubber con-
tent."

F.2958/63.-3



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 68).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the
eighteenth day of March, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of
Customs be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British Intermediate General
Tariff Items. Preferential Tariff. Tariff.Tariff.

DIVISION XII.-HIDES, LEATHER, AND RUBBER.

332. By omitting paragraph (6) of sub-item (B) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

" (6) Transmission conveyor or elevator belts or belting of
vulcanised rubber or synthetic rubber, including
such goods of textile or glass fibre fabrics yarns or
threads impregnated coated covered or laminated
with rubber or synthetic rubber, provided that for
the purposes of this paragraph, balata, gutta percha
and similar natural gums and factice derived from
oils, shall be deemed to be vulcanised rubber whether
or not they have been vulcanised-

(a) Conveyor or elevator belts or belting, not
being wholly of rubber or synthetic rubber

ad val.
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

ad val.
provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 8th February,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

(b) Other - - - ad val.

271 per cent. 371 per cent.

20 per cent. 20 per cent.

27+ per cent. 371 per cent.

40 per cent.

20 per cent.

40 per cent."

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.

483. By omitting sub-item (A) and inserting in its stead the fol-
lowing sub-item:-

"(A) Impregnated coated or laminated with artificial plastic
material-

(1) Conveyor or elevator belts or belting - ad val. 27+ per cen
and, in addition, a temporary duty of

ad val. 20 per cent
provided that, in respect of such goods in
direct transit to Australia on 8th February,
1963 which are entered for home consump-
tion on arrival, no temporary duty shall be
payable.

(2) Other - - ad val. 271 per cen

t.

t.

37 per cent.

20 per cent.

40 per cent.

20 per cent.

t. 37J per cent. 1 40 per cent."



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 405
28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 69).
1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by

Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals,
and that the amendments operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-fifth
day of March, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs be
collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, "Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British
Tariff Items. Preferential Intermediate General

Tariff. Tariff. Tariff.

DIVISION VL-METALS AND MACHINERY.
176. By inserting after paragraph (4) of sub-item (E

paragraph as follows:-
"(5) Garment formers (finishers) -

) a new

- ad val. 221 per cent. 321 per cent. 35 per cent."

DIVISION XVI.-MISCELLANEOUS.
459. By omitting sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (1) of sub-

item (B).
By omitting paragraphs (2) and (3) of sub-item (B) and

inserting in their stead the following paragraphs:-
"(2) Silk-worm gut, non-sterile - ad val.

(3) Imitation catgut, non-sterile - - ad val.

463. By omitting from paragraph (2) of sub-item (B) the words
" Sewing yarns or threads, of flax fibres or of ramie fibres
or of flax and ramie fibres, with or without true hemp or
manila hemp fibres-" and inserting in their stead the
words " Multi-ply flax sewing yarns, glazed or polished-".

By omitting paragraph (3) of sub-item (B) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraphs:-

" (3) Other glazed or polished multi-ply flax yarns - ad val.
(4) Single ply yarns-

(a) Of No. 25 lea or coarser - - ad val.
(b) Other - - - - ad val.

(5) Multi-ply yarns, not covered by paragraph (2) or (3)-
(a) Sewing yarns-

(1) Having a running length not exceeding
2,400 yards per lb.; sewing yarns a
ply of which is No. 24 lea or coarser

ad val.
(2) Having a running length exceeding 2,400

yards per lb. and not exceeding 2,500
yards per lb.; sewing yarns a ply of
which is finer than No. 24 lea and not
finer than No. 25 lea - ad val.

(3) Other - - - - ad val.
(b) Other-

(1) Having a ply which is No. 25 lea or
coarser - - - ad val.

(2) Other - - - - ad val.

466. By omitting sub-item (s) and inserting in its stead the
following sub-item:-

"(B) Yarns-
(1) Containing not less than 20 per cent. by weight

of wool calculated on the textile fibre
content - - - - per lb.

and ad val.
(2) Other - - - - - ad val.

467. By omitting the words " or of manila hemp or of true hemp
and manila hemp or having a textile fibre content in chief
part by weight of true hemp or manila hemp or of true
hemp and manila hemp," and inserting in their stead the
words " or having a textile fibre content in chief part by
weight of true hemp,".

By omitting from paragraph (2) of sub-item (B) the words
" Sewing yarns or threads of true hemp or manila hemp
fibres with or without flax fibres-" and inserting in their
stead the words " Multi-ply sewing yarns, glazed or
polished- ".

By omitting paragraph (3) of sub-item (B) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraphs:-

"(3) Other glazed or polished multi-ply yarns - ad val.

7+ per cent.
71 per cent.

17+ per cent.

12f per cent.
Free

15 per cent. 15 per cent.
15 per cent. 15 per cent."

45 per cent.

271 per cent.
71 per cent.

50 per cent.

371 per cent.
7+ per cent.

20 per cent. 42+ per cent. 471 per cent.

20 per cent. 371 per cent. 47+ per cent.
Free 71 per cent. 71 per cent.

121 per cent. 271 per cent. 371 per cent.
Free 74 per cent. 7+ per cent."

4d.
10 per cent.
17+ per cent.

17+ per cent.

10d. Is.
171 per cent. 30 per cent.
30 per cent. 40 per cent."

45 per cent. 50 per cent.



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE-continued.

IMPORT DUTIES-continued.

TariffBritish ntermediate GeneraTariff Items. Preferential Tariff. Tariff.
Tariff.

Division XVI.-Miscellaneous-continued.

467.-continued.
" (4) Single ply yarns-

(a) Of No. 25 lea or coarser - - ad val. 121 per cent. 271 per cent. 37+ per cent.
(b) Other - - - - - ad val. Free 7+ per cent. 7+ per cent.

(5) Multi-ply yarns, not glazed or polished-
(a) Sewing yarns-

(1) Having a running length not exceeding
2,400 yards per lb.; sewing yarns a
ply of which is No. 24 lea or coarser

ad val. 20 per cent. 421 per cent. 47+ per cent.
(2) Having a running length exceeding 2,400

yards per lb. and not exceeding 2,500
yards per lb.; sewing yarns a ply of
which is finer than No. 24 lea and not
finer than No. 25 lea - ad val. 20 per cent. 371 percent. 471 per cent.

(3) Other - - ad val. Free 71 per cent. 71 per cent.
(b) Other-

(1) Having a ply which is No. 25 lea or
coarser - ad val. 12+ per cent. 27+ per cent. 371 per cent.

(2) Other - - ad val. Free 7+ per cent. 71 per cent."

468. By omitting paragraph (1) of sub-item (a) and inserting in
its stead the following paragraph:-

" (1) Of coir or having a textile fibre content in chief part by
weight of coir, not covered by paragraph (2) - Free Free Free"

470. By omitting sub-item (A) and inserting in its stead the
following sub-item:-

"(A) Yarns of paper or in chief part by weight of paper, not
being metallized yarns - - - ad val. Free 71 per cent. 71 per cent."

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (No. 70).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by
Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals
and that, on and after the twenty-ninth day of March, One thousand nine hundred and
sixty-three, Duties of Customs be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff
Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and
6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

British Intermediate General
Tariff Items. Preferential Tariff. TarifTariff. Tariff. Tariff.Tariff.

DIVISION IX.-DRUGS AND CHEMICALS.

280. By inserting after sub-item (u) a new sub-item as follows:-
"(v) Phthalic esters n.e.i., being chemicals, but not including

cellulose acetate phthalate - - ad val. Free 7j per cent. 71 per cent.
and, in addition, temporary duties as follow:-

per ton £25 £25 £25
and, for each £1 or part thereof by which the F.O.B.
price is less than £175 per ton - per ton £1 £1 £1
provided that, in respect of such goods in direct
transit to Australia on 1st March, 1963 which are
entered for home consumption on arrival, no tem-
porary duties shall be payable."



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 407

28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF AMENDMENT (NO. 71).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, as proposed to be amended by

Customs Tariff Proposals, be further amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals

and that, on and after the twenty-ninth day of March, One thousand nine hundred and

sixty-three, Duties of Customs be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff Proposals" mean the Customs Tariff

Proposals introduced into the House of Representatives on the following dates:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

IMPORT DUTIES.

Tariff Items.
British

Preferential
Tariff.

Intermediate
Tariff.

General
Tariff.

II I

DIVISION VI.-METALS AND MACHINERY.

181. By omitting sub-item (H) and inserting in its stead the

following sub-item:-
" (H) Capacitors, fixed or variable-

(1) Of types used as standards or references for

comparison and measuring purposes ad val.
(2) Variable including trimmers or padders, not

covered by paragraph (1)-
(a) Of 0.0001 microfarad capacity or less

each
or ad val.

whichever rate returns the higher duty.
(b) Of capacities exceeding 0.0001 micro-

farad and not exceeding 0.001
microfarad, including such capa-
citors when ganged provided at
least one capacitor in the gang is
of capacity exceeding 0.0001
microfarad and not exceeding
0.001 microfarad

per capacitor in the unit or gang
or ad val.

whichever rate returns the higher duty.
(c) Other - - - ad val.

(3) Fixed, power factor correction, having a rating
of IkVar or higher - - ad val.

(4) Electrolytic-
(a) Working voltage rating, 100 volts or

less - ad val.
(b) Other - - - ad val.

(5) Other-
(a) Paper - ad val.
(b) Mica each

or ad val.
whichever rate returns the higher duty.

(c) Ceramic - ad val.
(d) Plastic - ad val.
(e) Other - ad val.

27+ per cent. 45 per cent.

9d. Is. 3d.
27+ per cent. 45 per cent.

Is. l d.
27+ per cent.

90 per cent.

22 per cent.

90 per cent.
90 per cent.

90 per cent.
3d.

27J per cent.

90 per cent.
90 per cent.
90 per cent.

2s. 71d.
45 per cent.

100 per cent.

50 per cent.

100 per cent.
100 per cent.

100 per cent.
4d.

45 per cent.

100 per cent.
100 per cent.
100 per cent.

45 per cent.

Is. 3d.
45 per cent.

2s. 71d.
45 per cent.

100 per cent.

50 per cent.

100 per cent.
100 per cent.

100 per cent.
4d.

45 per cent.

100 per cent.
100 per cent.

100 per cent."

CUSTOMS TARIFF (CANADA PREFERENCE) AMENDMENT (NO. 6).

That the Second Schedule to the Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) 1960-1962, as

proposed to be amended by Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) Proposals introduced into

the House of Representatives on the sixth day of December, One thousand nine hundred and

sixty-two, be amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals, and that the amendment

operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-first day of December,

One thousand nine hundred and sixty-two, and that Duties of Customs be collected

accordingly.
THE SCHEDULE.

Omit consecutive number 50 in column I and the particulars specified in columns 2 and 3 opposite to

consecutive number 50 and insert the following consecutive number and particulars:-

S50 . - 359 (F) - -Omit '271 per cent.', Road wheels of the disc
insert ' 30 per cent.', type, in sizes known

as-
6.0 by 20
6.5 by 20
7.0 by 20
7.5 by 20

and parts therefor."



408 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

CUSTOMS TARIFF (CANADA PREFERENCE) AMENDMENT (No. 7).
That the Second Schedule to the Customs Tariff(Canada Preference) 1960-1962, as proposed

to be amended by Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) Proposals introduced into the House
of Representatives on the sixth day of December, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-
two, be amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals, and that the amendments
operate, and be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-first day of December, One
thousand nine hundred and sixty-two, and that Duties of Customs be collected accordingly.

THE SCHEDULE.
1. Omit consecutive number 11 in column 1 and the particulars in columns 2 and 3 opposite to consecutive

number 11 and insert the following consecutive numbers and particulars:-
" 11 .. .. .. 165 () . .. Omit '5 per cent.',

insert' 2d.'.
" A .. .. .. 166 (A) .. .. Omit ' 10 per cent.',

insert ' 40 per cent.
£3'.

" 11 a .. .. .. 166 (B) .. . Omit ' 10 per cent.',
insert '40 per cent.

£10 '.
" 11 c .. .. .. 166 (c) .. .. Omit ' 10 per cent.',

insert '40 per cent.
£4'.

" 11 D .. .. .. 166 (D) .. .. Omit ' 10 per cent.',
insert '40 per cent.

2d.'."

2. Omit consecutive numbers 13, 14, 15 and 16 in column I and the particulars in columns 2 and 3
opposite to consecutive numbers 13, 14, 15 and 16 and insert the following consecutive numbers and
particulars:-

" 13 . 176 (F) (3) (c) (2) Omit ' 10 per cent.',
insert ' 40 per cent.

2d.'.
" 14 .. 176 (F) (3) (c) (3) Omit ' 5 per cent.',

insert ' 2d.'."

CUSTOMS TARIFF (CANADA PREFERENCE) AMENDMENT (No. 8).
That the Second Schedule to the Customs Tariff(CanadaPreference) 1960-1962, as proposed

to be amended by Customs Tariff (Canada Preference) Proposals introduced into the House
of Representatives on the sixth day of December, One thousand nine hundred and sixty-two,
be amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals, and that the amendments operate,
and be deemed to have operated, on and after the fifth day of February, One thousand nine
hundred and sixty-three, and that Duties of Customs be collected accordingly.

THE SCHEDULE.
Omit consecutive number 50 in column 1 and the particulars specified in columns 2, 3 and 4 opposite to

consecutive number 50 and insert the following consecutive numbers and particulars:-
"50 .. . 359 (F) (1) . Omit ' 274 per cent.',

insert ' 30 per cent.'.
50A .. .. 359 (F) (2) .. Omit ' 274 per cent.', Road wheels of the disc type in

insert ' 30 per cent.'. sizes known as-
6.0 by 20
6.5 by 20
7.0 by 20
7.5 by 20

Sand parts therefor."

CUSTOMS TARIFF (NEW ZEALAND PREFERENCE) AMENDMENT (NO. 12).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) 1933-1962, as
proposed to be amended by Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) Proposals, be further
amended as set out in the Schedule to these Proposals, and that the amendments operate, and
be deemed to have operated, on and after the twenty-first day of December, One thousand nine
hundred and sixty-two, and that Duties of Customs be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) Proposals"
mean the Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) Proposals introduced into the House of
Representatives on the following dates, namely:-

15th November, 1962;
29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.



VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES. 409

28th March, 1963.

THE SCHEDULE.

Tariff Rates on
Consecutive Tariff Item Goods the Produce

No. Ia te m. or Manufacture of
New Zealand.

23. By omitting-
"Textile fabrics, wholly of wool, to which sub-item (D) of item 479 in the

Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, or that Act as amended from
time to time, or as proposed to be amended from time to time by a Customs
Tariff alteration proposed in the Parliament, applies - - - 6d. per square

yard and 174
per cent. ad
val."

and inserting in its stead the following:-
"Textile fabrics, wholly of wool, to which sub-item (E) of item 479 in the

Schedule to the Customs Tariff 1933-1962, or that Act as amended from
time to time, or as proposed to be amended from time to time by a Customs
Tariff alteration proposed in the Parliament, applies - - - 6d. per square

yard and 171
per cent. ad
val."

CUSTOMS TARIFF (NEW ZEALAND PREFERENCE) AMENDMENT (No. 13).

1. That the Schedule to the Customs Tariff(New Zealand Preference) 1933-1962, as proposed
to be amended by Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) Proposals, be further amended as
set out in the Schedule to these Proposals, and that the amendments operate, and be deemed
to have operated, on and after the twenty-first day of December, One thousand nine hundred
and sixty-two, and that Duties of Customs be collected accordingly.

2. That in these Proposals, " Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) Proposals"
mean the Customs Tariff (New Zealand Preference) Proposals introduced into the House of
Representatives on the following dates, namely:-

15th November, 1962;

29th November, 1962; and

6th December, 1962.

THE SCHEDULE.

Tariff Rates on Goods
Consecutive Tariff Item, the Produce orNo. TariffItem. Manufacture of

New Zealand.

39. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following item:-
"39 166 (A) Hay rakes, horse Free"

49. By omitting the item and inserting in its stead the following item:-
"49 167 (B) Clothes wringers for household use 171 per cent.

ad val."

52. By omitting the item.

Progress to be reported, and leave asked to sit again.

The House resumed; Mr. Lucock reported accordingly.
Ordered-That the House will, at a later hour this day, again resolve itself into the said Committee.

15. PAPERS.-The following Papers were presented, by command of His Excellency the Governor-
General-

Tariff Board-Reports-
Aluminium and aluminium alloys.
Automotive electrical equipment.
Capacitors.
Cotton yarns.
Electric shavers.
Garment formers (finishers).
General textile reference interim report on " Other yarns ".
Linseed, linseed oil, &c.
Metal working machines.
Precision ground tapered roller bearings.
Styrene monomers, polymers and copolymers.
Synthetic rubber.
Taximeters.
Tinned iron and steel hoop, strip, plates and sheets.
Vehicle road wheels, rims and rim side rings.
Weftless fabrics and interim report under the general textile reference on weftless fabrics.

Severally ordered to be printed.



410 VOTES AND PROCEEDINGS OF THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES.

28th March, 1963.

The following Papers were presented, pursuant to Statute-
Tariff Board Act-Special Advisory Authority-Reports-

Belting fabric.
Conveyor belting.
Furnishing fabrics.
Knives incorporating " Waterloo " bolsters.
Phthalates (Phthalic Esters).
Polyethylene.

Severally ordered to be printed.

16. MALAYSIA-MINISTERIAL STATEMENT.-Sir Garfield Barwick (Minister for External Affairs), by leave,
made a Ministerial Statement with reference to recent developments in the proposed establishment of
Malaysia.

17. LOAN (HOUSING) BILL 1963.-The Order of the Day having been read for the resumption of the debate
on the question, That the Bill be now read a second time-

Debate resumed.
Debate adjourned (Mr. Curtin), and the resumption of the debate made an Order of the Day for the next

sitting.

18. PAPERS.-The following Papers were presented, pursuant to Statute-
Customs Tariff-Orders-Customs (Intermediate Tariff) Nos. 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 103,

104, 105, 106, 107, 108.
Customs Tariff (Primage Duties)-Orders-Customs Tariff (Primage Duties) Nos. 120, 121, 122,

123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135.

19. ADJOURNMENT.-Mr. Swartz (Minister for Repatriation) moved, That the House do now adjourn.
Debate ensued.
Mr. Pollard rising to address the House-
Closure.-Mr. Chaney moved, That the question be now put.
Question-That the question be now put-put.
The House divided (The Speaker, Sir John McLeay, in the Chair)-

Mr. Adermann
Mr. Allan
Mr. Anthony
Mr. Barnes
Sir G. Barwick
Mr. Bate
Mr. Brimblecombe
Mr. Buchanan
Mr. Bury
Mr. Chipp
Mr. Cleaver
Mr. Cockle

Mr. Armitage
Mr. Barnard
Mr. Beaton
Mr. Beazley
Mr. Benson
Mr. Bryant
Mr. Cairns
Mr. C. R. Cameron
Mr. D. J. Cameron
Mr. Clark
Mr. Clay
Mr. Collard

Mr. Cramer
Mr. Davidson
Mr. Davis
Mr. Dean
Mr. Downer
Mr. Drury
Mr. England
Mr. Erwin
Mr. Failes
Mr. Fairbairn
Mr. Fairhall
Mr. Falkinder

Mr. Comber
Mr. Cope
Mr. Costa
Mr. Courtnay
Mr. Crean
Mr. Cross
Mr. Curtin
Mr. Daly
Mr. Davies
Mr. Einfeld
Mr. Fuller
Mr. Fulton

AYES, 58.

Mr. Forbes
Mr. Fox
Mr. J. M. Fraser
Mr. Freeth
Mr. Hasluck
Mr. Haworth
Mr. Holt
Mr. Holten
Mr. Howson
Mr. Jack
Mr. Jess
Mr. Kelly

NOES, 55.
Mr. Galvin
Mr. Gray
Mr. Griffiths
Mr. Hansen
Mr. Harding
Mr. Harrison
Mr. Hayden
Mr. Haylen
Mr. James
Mr. Johnson
Mr. Jones
Mr. Kearney

Sir W. Kent Hughes
Mr. Killen
Mr. King
Mr. Leslie
Mr. Lindsay
Mr. Lucock
Mr. Mackinnon
Mr. McMahon
Mr. McNeill
Mr. Nixon
Mr. Opperman
Mr. Roberton

Mr. Snedden
Mr. Stokes
Mr. Swartz
Mr. Townley
Mr. Turner
Mr. Wentworth
Mr. Whittorn
Mr. Wilson

Tellers:
Mr. Chaney
Mr. Turnbull

Mr. Stewart
Mr. Uren
Mr. Ward
Mr. Webb
Mr. Whitlam

Tellers:

Mr. Coutts
Mr. Duthie

Mr. Makin
Mr. McGuren
Mr. McIvor
Mr. Minogue
Mr. Monaghan
Mr. O'Brien
Mr. O'Connor
Mr. Peters
Mr. Pollard
Mr. Reynolds
Mr. Riordan
Mr. Sexton

And so it was resolved in the affirmative.
And the question-That the House do now adjourn-was put accordingly, and passed.

And then the House, at five minutes past eleven o'clock p.m., adjourned until Tuesday next at half-past two
o'clock p.m.

MEMBERS PRESENT.-All Members were present (at some time during the sitting) except Mr. Calwell, Mr.
Russell and Mr. Thompson.

A. G. TURNER,

Clerk of the House of Representatives.

By Authority: A. J. ARTHUR, Commonwealhd Government Printer, Canberra,


