
SUBMISSION

AngelikaTreichier
6/66AddisonRoad
Manly NSW 2095

TheSecretary
PublicWorksCommittee PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE
ParliamentHouse
CanberraACT 2600 F-.-

19 MAY 2006
L____

RECEIVED am.

DearSir/Madam,

Submissionto Inquiry into RedevelopmentofAustralian institute of Police
Management,
North headManly NSW

I amwriting this submissionasa residentof Manly’sEasternHill, avoluntaryPenguin
Warden, a volunteerbandicootmonitoron North Headanda voluntaryrubbishcollector
at Collins Beach.I walk therealmostdaily for thesimple reasonthat it is secluded,quiet
andfull of naturalwonders.I collectthewashedup refuseandtalk to boatownersabout
theprotectionoftheLittle Penguins,who havechosentherocky foreshorebelow the
Institutefor theirbreedingactivities.Theyneedpeaceandquietandprotectionfrom
humanactivity which alreadyhasbeenaffectingtheirnumbersnegativelythroughover
developmentin Manly.
I appreciatethefactthat sofar theInstitute’sresidentsandvisitorshavebeenco-
operativeandsensitiveto thepenguin’sneeds;however,I amworried aboutthefuture if
theproposedredevelopmentgoesahead.

Theconsequenceofdemolition, buildingactivity, increasein accommodation,
commercialletting, public access,openair entertainment,increasein visitorswould
inevitablybe:

Morenoise
Moretraffic
Morepollution
LossofPenguinhabitat
LossofBandicoothabitat

1. All thesewouldhavea detrimentaleffect on this area’sFAUNA AND FLORA

2. My otherconcernis theHISTORIC SIGNIFICANCE ofthewholeof Collins Flat.



Theexistingbuildingsusedto bepartoftheQuarantineStationwhich is of greatheritage
valuefor Australia’shistoryof white settlement.By demolishingandreplacingsomeof
thebuildings (onewith 3 levels)thevisual characteristicsof thisareawouldbe altered
anddestroyedforever.

3. My thirdpoint is a concernfor theresidentsoftheimmediateNEIGHBORhOOD.
LastnightI wassitting on afriend’sbalconyattheendofWoodStreet,just acrossthe
waterfrom theInstitute.Apart from penguins’matingnoises,we alsoheardloud laughter
from threeladiessitting on theInstitute’sverandah.Thiscontributedverynicelyto the
generalatmosphere.Canyou imagine,however,what it wouldbelike if therewasa
‘FunctionCentre” anda 35sqmopen ‘EntertainmentDeck’?

IN THE WAKE OF NORTH HEAD’S LISTING AS A NATIONAL HERITAGE
SITE, suchradicalredevelopmentof oneofits mostsignificantpartswouldbe a very sad
sign of completedisregardfor thewonderful treasureswehavein Australia.

Thankyou verymuchfor givingmetheopportunityto makethis submissionand for
grantingan extensionoftime for thepurposeof addingthesignaturesby concerned
fellow residentsandvisitors.

Yours Faithfully,
AngelikaTreichler

Attached:356 signatures


