
TFIE UNIVERSITY OF

MELBOURNE
24 July, 2003

TheSecretary EMP Inquiry
StandingCommitteeon EmploymentandWorkplaceRelations SubmissionNo. 27
HouseofRepresentatives
ParliamentHouse
CanberraACT 2600

Re: Inquiry into Employment:Increasingparticipationin paid work

In responseto theinvitation ofMrs Dc-AnneKelly MP to contributeto theaboveinquiry, I
would like to submitthreeresearchpapers(attached),whichexamineissuesrelevantto the
inquiry. Thevalueofthesepapersis primarily asbackgroundinformation.

1. ‘Relianceon IncomeSupport in Australia: PrevalenceandPersistence’(with DrYi-Ping
Tseng).In thispaper,wedocumenttheextentofrelianceon incomesupportpaymentsof
working-agepersonsin Australia,finding thatalmost onethird ofpersonsarein familiesthat
receiveincomesupportpaymentsat somestageof theyear,comparedwith approximately
onequartertwo decadesago.Furthermore,onesixthofincomesupportrecipientsreceive
paymentscontinuouslyformorethan5½years.Theproportionoftotal incomethatincome
supportrecipientsderivefrom welfarepayments(asopposedto wagesandsalaries,
investments,etc.)hasremainedessentiallyunchangedsince1982. This suggeststherehas
beenlittle increasein participationin paidwork amongincomesupportrecipients.

2. ‘LabourMarketOutcomesandWelfareDependenceofPersonswith Disabilitiesin
Australia’.A significantfindingofthisresearchis that, althoughratesofparticipationin paid
employmentdo notappearto havedeclinedforpersonswith disabilitiesin recentyears,the
proportionofworking-agepeoplereportingadisability hasgrowndramatically.Since
personswith disabilitiesarelesslikely to be employed,non-employmentassociatedwith
disabilityhasgrownsubstantially.

3. ‘TheEffectsof Changesin Family CompositionandEmploymentPatternson the
Distribution ofIncomein Australia: 1982 to 1997-1998’(with AssociateProfessorDavid
Johnson).Amongthesignificantfindings ofthispaperis thatchangesin thedistributionof
employmentacrossfamilies— for example,growthin bothtwo-earnerandno-earnerfamilies
— accountfor approximatelyhalfthegrowthin inequalityofprivateincome(thatis, income
beforegovernmenttransfersandincometaxes)between1982and1997-8.

Yours sincerely,

(Dr) RogerWilkins
ResearchFellow
MelbourneInstituteofAppliedEconomicand SocialResearch
UniversityofMelbourne
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