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Notice

Question:
I understandthattwo states,QueenslandandVictoria, haveraisedspecificissues.I
would be interestedto knowwhatthoseissueswere.

Answer:
TheDepartmentofCommunications,InformationTechnologyandtheArts (DCITA)
provideda copyofapreliminarydraftoftheConventionto all StatesandTerritories
throughthe StandingCommitteeonTreaties(SCOT)processin October2004.
Jurisdictionswereaskedto providewrittencommentson thedraft.

Victoria andQueenslandweretheonlyjurisdictionsto raisesubstantiveissues.
NeitherStateobjectedto orexpressedconcernwith theprinciplesofthedraft. Rather
theircommentswereofanoperationalnature. Specifically,theysoughtclarification
ona numberofthedraft Convention’sarticlesandtheirapplicationin Australia,in
particulartheapplicationofthe Conventionto sub-elitelevelathletes.Theissues
raisedwerelargelyaddressedby officials.

In earlyAugust2005,DCITA provideda copyofthefinal draft oftheConventionto
SCOTmembersfor their informationandcommentif theyhad anyconcerns.
Victoria wastheonlyjurisdictionthatresponded,notingthatit wasyetto beclearly
articulatedtheextentto whichtheWorld Anti-DopingCode(theCode)will be
appliedto sub-eliteathleteswho arenot, in atechnicalsense,deemedto besubjectto
dopingcontrolprograms.

This issueswasnotcoveredspecificallyin theUNESCOConventionbecausethe
World Anti-Doping Codeleavesthis aspectto individualjurisdictionsto determine.

Thetestingprovisionsofthe Codeapplyto internationalathletes(asdefinedby each
internationalsportingfederation)andnationalathletes(asdefinedby eachnational
anti-dopingorganisation).In practice,in Australia’scasethepoolofathletescovered
by theCodeis establishedbetweentheAustralianSportsCommissionandeach
NationalSportingOrganisationin the contextoffinalisationof sports’ anti-doping
policies. TheAustralianSportsDing Agency(ASDA) is fundedto providedrug
testingandeducationto athletesin thispool.

To theextentthat StatesandTerritoriesmaywishto testanyathletesoutsidethis
pool,this is apolicy andresourcingmatterfor eachjurisdiction(notingthat
jurisdictionsmaywish to contractASDA for suchtesting).



Question:
I assumethat, if theyareanelite athletewithin astateorganisation,theymayormay
notbeunderanAustralianGovernmentfundedorganisationaswell. Is that arelevant
point for thepurposeofthis convention?

Answer
Thisissueis notcoveredspecificallyin theConventionbecausetheWorld Anti-
DopingCodeleavesthis aspectto individualjurisdictionsto determine.

All AustralianSportsCommission(ASC) fundednationalsportingorganisations
(NSO)have,andmusthave,ASC approvedWorldAnti-Doping Code(Code)
compliantanti-dopingpolicies. All stateandterritory institutesandacademiesof
sporthaveASC approvedCodecompliantanti-dopingpolicies.

Theapplicationof theNSOAnti-Doping Policyto statesportingorganisationsand
statelevel athletesdependsuponthestructureandpolicy frameworkof thesport. A
statelevel athletemaybeboundby aNSO Anti-DopingPolicy.

Any athletewhoreceivesfundingand/orassistancefrom theASC is boundby the
ASC’s Anti-DopingPolicy. This includesathletessuchasAustralianInstituteof
SportScholarshipholdersandrecipientsofDirectAthleteSupport.Theseathletes
mayalsobeboundbytheirNSO Anti-DopingPolicyandstateandterritory institutes
andacademyof sportpolicies.



Question:
My secondquestionis in relationto thefundingofarticle 17. It seemsto methat it is
somewhatadhoc.Thereareno specificfundingcriteriain termsofthenumberof
dollarsthatnationswould give orbeexpectedto give. Canyou commenton that?Are
thereanyannexuresthat might referto it? If it is voluntary,somecountrieswill bein
apositionto contributemore.Wemaydecide,for whateverreason,not to contribute.
Werethereanydiscussionsaboutexpectationsor the like (on funding)?

Answer:
Article 17 oftheConventionspecificallyprovidesthat‘all contributionsby state
partiesandotheractors(to thevoluntaryfund)shallbevoluntary’.

Therewasno formaldiscussionduringthepreparationoftheConventiononwhat
countriesmight beexpectedto contributeto thefund,bearingin mindthatunderthe
termsof Article 17, individual countriesmaychoosenot to contributeat all.

UNESCOmayprovidefurtheradviceon theVoluntaryFundoncetheConvention
entersinto force(following thedepositofthethirtieth instrumentofratification,
acceptance,approvaloraccession).




