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AIRLINE SECURITY

* BAGGAGE AND CARGO *

I havebeenemployedin the airlineindustryfor some25 plus yearsanduntil recently
hadavery extensiveworkingknowledgeofairportprocedures.I haveworkedat a
numberofmajorairportsincludingSydneyandBrisbaneandCanberra.

I believethatoneaspectofairline operationswhichmaystill provideameansof
transferringillicit goodsbetweenAustraliancities whichhasyet to bescmtinisedand
tightenedup is thetransferof “RushBaggage”.

RushBaggageis passenger’sbaggagewhichhasnot accompaniedpassengersontheir
bookedflight/s for onereasonoranotherandis directedto analternativeflight in
orderto be restoredto that/ thosepassengers.

Therecordingofsuchbaggageis haphazardto saytheleastandmanualbaggagetags
aregenerallyusedwith little recording. It would notbehardto transfera specific
Blue suitcasefrom Cairnsto Hobartwith verylittle likelihoodof anychecksasto
how oftenthecasetravelledorwhatcontentswereinsidebeingmadewhatsoever.

Anotherareawhereillicit goodscouldbetransferredby industryknowledgeablestaff
couldbeviainterportcompanymail systems— thesesystemsreceivevery little
monitoring!

Cargomovementsshouldalsobetightenedup asvirtually anyillicit goodscouldbe
transferreddomesticallywith very little scrutiny. With cargosecurityrelieson a
declarationby theshipperthatapackagecontainsno goodsofadangerousnature.As
far asI amawarethereis no X-rayofand domesticallyconsignedgoodswithin
Australia. It would notbedifficult for anyonewith a little researchto consignan
explosivedeviceonaspecificflight within Australia.

Baggagetampering/ pilfering hasbeenrife in theairlineindustryfor yearsit seems
thatit takesacaselike theChapelleCorbycaseto bringtheseunpleasantaspectsof
theairlineindustryinto thepublic arena.Theairlinesknowandwill admitthatthis
problemhasbeenofmajorconcernfor manyyears— somuchsothatanumberof
covertCCTV andothertechnologicaloperationshavebeenmountedat timesoverthe
yearsasspatesoftheseproblemshaveoccurred.

This informationis notmeantto point fingersatspecificairline/sbut is providedin
goodfaith to assistin theoverall improvementofAustralianairline security.

L McMahon.


