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BriefingPointsfor Discussionson AgedCareIssues 9
with Mr JohnCobb MP at BrokenHill 24 February2004N> C At

Legacyis a uniquelyAustralianbenevolentorganisationdedicatedto th~a4~&~~
depenclantsof deceasedveteranswho died on activeserviceor subsequently.( C~
including thedependantsoftoday’sservicepersonnelkilled while on hazardous
serviceorwhile training for war.

• ThroughoutAustraliatherearepresentlysome133,000widows~ and700 dependant
children,and 1,100 disableddependentsregisteredwith Legacy. Only about60%of
thesewidows arein receiptof theWarWidowsPension(i.e. husband’sdeath
acceptedasbeingdueto war service). With theexceptionofa relatively small
numberstill in thework forceandasmall numberofself.fundedretirees,the
remaining40%rely on theagedpension.

• PersonalLegacysupportto thesewidows andchildrenis providedby some7,000
volunteers(knownasLegatees)who arelargely ex-servicethemselves.Legacy
funding is not governmentbasedandwerely on fundraisingby our volunteersandthe
generosityof thepublic to providedienecessaryfundsfor this work to continue.

• Themajority ofour widows areelderly andthis resultsin an ongoingfocuson aged
careandhealthissues. In SA & BrokenHill therearepresentlysome 12,000wIdows
registeredwith some30%livIng In countryareas, On presentplanningtheLegacy
taskwill continueuntil atleastthe late2020s.

LegacyIn BrokenHill

• In BrokenHill therearepresentlysome293 widows with 240of’ theseaged75 years
orabove(Of this total only six arewidowsofpost WWII veterans,e.g.Korea&
Vietnam,but interestinglyit includesfourwho weremarriedto WWI veterans). Of’
thetotal, 179 widows arein receiptoftheWar WidowsPension. At presentthereare
no dependantchildrenordisableddependantsregistered.

• As WWII veteranspass-onwe expectthetotai numberofwidows to increaseslightly
overthe nextfew yearsandthento graduallydecline. Thenumberof widowsof
veteransfrom post-WWII conflicts will howeverincreaseandby 2025~viemayhave
asmanyas 80 mostlyelderlywidows registeredin Broken Hill. We canalsoexpect
to havea fewdependantchildrenanddisableddependantsregistered.

• Some60 widowsaremembersofthe BrokenHill LegacyWidowsClub which is a
socialgrouprun by thewidows but comingundertheauspicesof Legacy(Australia-
wide thereare430suchWidowsClubs). It meetsregularlyproviding iftnpirtaiM
mutualsupportandcomradeshipforoftenlonely widows.

• In BrokenHill thereare31 activevolunteers(Legatees)plus five on th.eReservebut
whoalsoassistto varying degrees.
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