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DearMs Gould

Thankyou for youradviceregardingthenationalinquiry into teachereducation.
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Edith CowanUniversitywelcomesMinisterNelson’sdecisionto initiate the inquiry and
would like to contributeto thedeliberationsoftheCommittee. Theprovenanceof this
Universityin teachereducationcanbe tracedbackto the foundationofClaremontTeachers
Collegein 1902. Edith CowanUniversityis theoldestandlargestproviderin Western
Australia:teachereducationis corebusinessfor this University.

Thetermsofreferencefor theInquiry areappropriatelywide-rangingandshouldencompass
thekey issueswith onepossibleexception. Manyofthechallengesfacingteachereducators
stemfrom thesamesourceasthosefacedby all professionalfacultiesin highereducation,
indeed,in theeducationsectormoregenerally. Costsofprovisionhaveescalatedbut so have
studentandcommunityexpectations. Thegovernanceandfundingstructuresfor thewhole
sector,includingteachereducation,arebeingtransformed. Universitiesnowprovideamuch
morediverserangeofcoursesfor amorediversestudentbodythanwasthecasein thepast.
This is also trueoftheschoolsectorswhereretentionrateshaveincreased,thecurriculumhas
expendedandregularclassroomteachersmustteacherverydifficult students. Theschool
sector,on whichteachereducationfacultiesdependfor support,is undersuchpressurethat
accessto supportofvariouskinds, includingplacesfor thepracticum,is harderto acquirethat
waspreviouslythecase. Thepoint is thatmanyofthepotentialinitiatives for improving
teachereductioncannotbe accomplishedby facultiesofteachereducationacting
independentlyoftherestoftheeducationsector.

TheCommitteemaycareto notethat towardsthe endof2003 theSchoolofEducation
completedacomprehensivereviewof its teachereductionprogramsandthensubjecteditself
to an externalreviewby stakeholdersandexternalteachereducationexperts. Manyissues
currentlyofconcernto yourCommitteewereaddressedby ECU’sSchoolofEducationduring
this reviewprocess. TheSchoolhasembarkedon amajorprogramofimprovementandhas
maderemarkableprogress. I might mention,for example,its professionalpartnershipswith
schoolsandschooldistricts, its literacyandnumeracyprogramsthat arestronglytied to the
School’ssuccessfulresearchprograms,theuseofdigital technologiesfor teachingand
research,the innovativemiddleyearsgraduateprogram,thesuccessfulapplicationofa
frameworkof credentialedprofessionallearningfor practisingteachersandnewwork on
behaviourmanagementin collaborationwith theDepartmentofEducation.
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I amgladto notethat theCommitteewill betravellingacrossAustraliaandwill visit teacher
educationinstitutions. MayI takethis opportunityto invite theCommitteeto Edith Cowan
University. We would be pleasedto hostany meetingsandprovidesuitableamenitiesfor the
Committee. Staffandstudentswill be availableto meetwith Committeememberson anyof
thedesignatedtopics.

I havedeferredpreparingageneralresponseto thetermsofreferencebecausetheyareso
wide-ranging. However,I would be pleasedto providedetailedsubmissionson anytopic
eitherprior to, or following, theCommittee’svisit to WesternAustralia.

May I suggestthatyou would liaise with Mr Lars Schmidt,theFaculty Manager. Mr Schmidt
servedasexecutiveofficer for the2003reviewoftheSchoolofEducationandis well
acquaintedwith the issuesofinterestto theCommittee. Hemaybe contactedbyphoneon
08-93706707orby email<l.schmidt@ecu.edu.au>.

Pleaseadvisemeif I canassistin anyothermatter.

Yours sincerely

ProfessorBill Louden
ExecutiveDean
Facultyof CommunityServices,EducationandSocial Sciences


