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ATTORNEY-GENERAL’ S DEPARTMENT

SUPPLEMENTARY SUBMISSION
TO THE

STANDING COMMITTEE ON LEGAL AND CONSTITUTIONAL AFFAIRS:

INQUIRY INTO
HARMONISATION OF LEGAL SYSTEMSRELATING TO TRADE AND

COMMERCE

This supplementarysubmissionprovidestheCommitteewith an updatein theareasthathave
progressedsinceMay2005. For easeofreference,theheadingsfrom theDepartment’soriginal
submissionhavebeenretained.

1 INTRODUCTION

No updaterequired.

2 MECHANISMS FOR ACHIEVING HARMONISATION

No updaterequired.

3 FORUMS FOR PURSUING HARMONISATION

3.1 The StandingCommitteeofAttorneys-General

No updaterequired.

3.2 Trans-TasmanWorking Group

TheTrans-TasmanWorking Groupissuedadiscussionpaperentitled ‘Trans-TasmanCourt
ProceedingsandRegulatoryEnforcement:A PublicDiscussionPaperby theTrans-Tasman
WorkingGroup’ on 1 August2005for commentby 4 November2005. This discussionpaperhas
alreadyseparatelybeenprovidedby theDepartmentto theSecretaryofthe Committee. The
discussionpaper:

• identifiedproblemsthatexistwith thecurrentarrangements

• consideredamoregeneralschemefor trans-Tasmanserviceofprocess,takingof
evidenceandrecognitionandenforcementofcourtordersandjudgments

• consideredamoregeneralschemefor trans-Tasmanco-operationbetweenregulators

• undertookappropriatedomesticconsultation,and

• proposedoptionsthatmaybepursued.
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32 submissionswerereceivedin responseto thediscussionpaper. Thesubmissionsbroadlysupport
theoverallpackageofproposals,althoughsomehaveraisedissuesthat will requirefurther
considerationby theWorking Group. Not all submissionsaddressedall issuesraisedin the
discussionpaper. TheWorkingGroup expectsto report,with recommendations,to both
governmentsin 2006. Furtherconsultationwith theStatesandTerritories,andotherstakeholders,
will beundertakenprior to theWorkingGroup’srecommendationsbeingfinalised.

4 CIVIL PROCEDURE

4.1 Serviceofproceedings

No updaterequired.

4.2 Forum non conveniensrules

No updaterequired.

4.3 StatuteofLimitations

No updaterequired.

4.4 EvidenceLaw

Australia

FollowingthereleaseoftheIssuesPaperin December2004,theAustralianLaw Reform
Commission(ALRC), theNSWLaw ReformCommissionandtheVictorian Law Reform
Commissionreleasedajoint DiscussionPaperin July 2005. TheDiscussionPaperincludedawide
rangeofreformproposalsonwhichfurtherpublic commentwassought. TheCommissionsalso
consultedandworkedwith thevariouslaw reformagenciesin otherstatesandterritories. Someof
theDiscussionPaperproposalswereminor ortechnicalin nature,orsoughtto clarify anexisting
ruleto avoidconfusion. Otherproposalsaimedto enhancetheoperationofevidenceruleswhich
otherwisework reasonablywell. Someidentifiedpracticaldifficultiesandsuggestedspecific
solutions.

ThethreeCommissionspreparedajoint final reportwhichwassubmittedto theirrespective
ministersby the duedateof5 December2005. Thereportwastabledin theAustralianand
Victorian Parliamentson 8 February2006 andreleasedon thesamedayin NewSouthWales.

TheQueenslandLaw ReformCommission(QLRC)completedits reviewandits reportwastabled
on 28 October2005. TheQLRC reviewfocusedon specificdifferencesbetweenQueenslandlaw
andtheuniform EvidenceActsaswell astheDiscussionPaper’sproposalsfor amendment,rather
thanrecommendingwhetherornot Queenslandshouldadopttheuniformlaws.
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TheLaw ReformCommitteeof theNorthernTerritoryhasbeenaskedby theNT AttorneyGeneral
to undertakea similar review. Thereviewwill considertheCommissions’final reportbefore
reporting.

TheStandingCommitteeofAttorneysGeneral(SCAG)agreedin November2005to establisha
workinggroupofjurisdictionsthatwish to participateto adviseministersassoonaspossibleon
amendmentsthatshouldbemadeto theuniform EvidenceActs,with aview to reinstatingahigh
level ofuniformity.

4.5 Recognitionandenforcementofjudgments

No updaterequired.

4.6 Miscellaneous

No updaterequired.

5 PERSONAL PROPERTY SECURITIES LAW

At theJuly 2005SCAGmeeting,theSCAG officers’ workinggroup—chairedby theAttorney-
General’sDepartment—presentedMinisterswith areporton thecurrentregulatoryframeworkfor
personalpropertysecuritiesin eachjurisdiction. Ministers askedtheworkingpartyto developa
discussionpapercanvassingoptionsfor reform,includingoptionsbasedon theNew Zealandmodel
ofregulation. Work on thediscussionpaperis continuing.

TheAustralianAttorney-Generalhasalsometwith severalkey stakeholdersincluding
representativesofthebankingindustry,small businessandgeneralindustrygroups.All
stakeholdershaveindicatedtheirsupportfor theproject.

6 INFORMATION LAW

6.1 Privacy

Commonwealthlegislation

TheSenateLegal andConstitutionalCommitteetabledtheirreport TheRealBigBrother— Review
ofthePrivacyAct1988on 23 June2005. TheCommitteerecommendedthatawider reviewbe
undertakenoftheprivacylawsto effectivelyprotecttheprivacyofAustraliansin the21st Century
andthatthis comprehensivereviewshouldbeundertakenby theALRC. Thisrecommendationis
similar to therecommendationin thePrivacyCommissioner’sreportthattheGovernmentshould
undertakeawide rangingreviewofprivacylawsin Australia. Consistentwith the
recommendationsin theserecentreports,theGovernmentannouncedon 30 January2006thatthe
ALRC will undertakeacomprehensivereviewof thePrivacyAct. TheALRC reviewis to be
completedby 31 March2008.
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ExistingStateand Territory legislation

TheTasmanianPersonalInformationandProtectionAct2004cameinto effect on 5 September
2005. Thelegislationappliesto theTasmanianpublic sector.

HealthPrivacy

TheHealthPrivacyCodewasnot consideredby Ministers in 2005andis now expectedto be
consideredin 2006.

Workplaceprivacy

Workplaceprivacyis an area—notmentionedin theDepartment’soriginalsubmission—whereit
wouldbedesirableto haveanationallyconsistentworkplaceprivacyregimeto provideprotection
for thepersonalinformationofworkers.

Privatesectoremployeerecordsareexcludedfrom theprotectionofthePrivacyAct1988(Cth).
This hascreatedanopportunityfor theStatesandTerritoriesto legislatein theareaofworkplace
privacyandhasledto inconsistenciesacrossjurisdictions. Forexample,NSWlegislation
governingtheprivacyofhealthinformationexemptsemployeerecordsfrom theoperationofthe
legislationwhereassimilar legislationin Victoria doesnot. NSWhasrecentlyenactedthe
WorkplaceSurveillanceAct2005. Victoria hasindicatedthat,following thereleaseoftheVictorian
Law ReformCommissionReporton WorkplacePrivacy,it mayalsolegislatein this area.

TheStandingCommitteeofAttorneys-Generalis currentlyexploringpossiblepolicy approachesfor
nationallyconsistentworkplaceprivacylaws.

6.2 Copyright

Reflectingthedynamicnatureofcopyrightlaw, anumberofreviewsoftheAustralian
CopyrightAct1968commencedin 2005. AspectsofNew Zealand’sCopyrightAct1994arealso
underreview. It will bedifficult to predictwhetherthelawswill becomemoreharmoniseduntil the
reviewsin AustraliaandNew Zealandarecompleted.

Exceptions

As outlinedin theoriginal submission,theAustralianGovernmentreleasedan IssuesPaperin May
2005consideringthecopyrightexceptionswhicharecurrentlyin theCopyrightAct andwhether
theyshouldbe extended.TheGovernmenthasnotyetmadedecisionsconcerningthis review. As
New Zealandis alsoconsideringthescopeofexceptionsin its CopyrightAct, it is unclearhowthe
scopeof exceptionsin eachcountrywill developandwhetherit will resultin greaterharmonisation.

PayTV

TheAustralianGovernmentalsoundertookareviewinto whethercertainunauthorisedactivities
involving accessto anduseofsubscriptionbroadcastsshouldbe criminalised. In June2005it was
announcedthat theGovernmentwouldbe amendingits law to makeit acriminal offenceto access
subscriptionbroadcastswithoutauthorisationandwithoutpayingasubscriptionfee, including
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dishonestlyaccessingpayTV in aprivatehomeaswell asfor commercialpurposes.These
amendmentsarecurrentlybeingdrafted.

New Zealand’sCopyrightAct includesanoffenceoffraudulentlyreceivingprogrammes.The
offenceapplieswhereapersonreceivesabroadcastserviceor cableprogramme,for which payment
is required,andtheyintentionallyavoidpayment1.While theelementsoftheoffenceunder
Australianlaw maydiffer to thatin theNew Zealandlaw, theAustralianamendmentsshouldresult
in greaterharmonisationofthelaw on this issue.

Enforcement

Copyrightenforcementbecamean increasinglystrongfocusfor theAustralianGovermnentin
2005. TheAustralianCopyrightAct containsalargenumberofcriminalprovisions. For example,
theAct criminalisesconductdoneon acommercialscalewhich siguificantlyprejudicesa copyright
owner,evenwherethereis no profit motive. This is not replicatedin New Zealand’scopyrightlaw.

A technicalreviewofthecriminalprovisionsin theAustralianAct is alsocurrentlyunderway.This
mayresultin furtherdifferencesbetweenAustralianandNew Zealandcopyrightlaw and
enforcementpolicy. p
In 2005,representativesoftheAttorney-General’sDepartmentengagedin adiscussionwith New
ZealandGovernmentrepresentativesaboutcopyrightenforcementpolicy andstrategy.

Digital Technology

As notedin theoriginal submission,Australiahasalreadyamendedits copyrightlaw to bring it into
compliancewith theWorld IntellectualPropertyOrganisation(WIPO) CopyrightTreaty(WCT),
whileNew Zealandis still in theprocessofamendingits law in relationto digital technology.This
meansthatthereis currentlysomedivergencebetweenour lawsin relationto digital technology.
ThismaychangefurtherasAustraliais currentlyundertakinganumberofreviewsin this area,
including:

• aninquiryby theHouseofRepresentativeCommitteeStandingCommitteeon Legal and
ConstitutionalAffairs into technologicalprotectionmeasureexceptions

• an IssuePaperreleasedon whetherthescopeof theschemewhich limits remediesagainst
CarriageServiceProvidersneedsto beexpanded

• areviewby theAttorney-General’sDepartmentoftheCopyrightAct to ensurecompliance
with Article 17.4.7oftheAustralian-UnitedStatesFreeTradeAgreement(AUSFTA) in relation
to technologicalprotectionmeasures,and

• completionofthereviewoftheDigital AgendaAmendmentsto theCopyrightAct.

Theoutcomesofthesereviewsmayimpacton theharmonisationofAustralianandNewZealand
copyrightlaw.

1 Section227 CopyrightAct 1994 (NZ)
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CrownCopyright

In April 2005 theAustralianCopyrightLaw ReviewCommittee(CLRC) publishedits reporton
Crowncopyright.ThereportrecommendedthatthespecialCrownsubsistenceandownership
provisionsin Pt VII of theCopyrightAct berepealed,sothat Governmentswould thenrelyon the
generalprovisionsto claim copyrightownership.Thereportmadeseveralotherrecommendations
includingabolishingcopyrightin certainmaterialsproducedby thejudicial, legislativeand
executivearmsofthegovernment,durationofCrowncopyrightandmanagementofCrown
copyright. TheCommonwealthandStateGovernmentsarejointly consideringtheirresponseto the
report.

New Zealandcopyrightlaw alsospecificallystatesthattheCrownownscopyrightin aworkmade
2by apersonemployed,engagedor contractedby theCrown. Unlike the currentAustralian

provisions,theNewZealandAct specificallyoutlinesthat copyrightdoesnot subsistin various
legal andparliamentarymaterial3. Againtheresponseby theAustralianGovernmentto theCLRC
reportwill determinethedegreeofharmonisationon this aspectofcopyrightlaw betweenthetwo
countries.

InternationalTreaties

Australiahascommittedto accedingto both theWCT andWIPO PerformancesandPhonograms
Treaty(WPPT). While New Zealandhasundertakenareviewinto the adoptionofdigital
technologyprovisions,it hasnotmadeanyfirm commitmentto accedingto theWCT4. Thereview
acknowledgedthatmanyofthechangesthatNew Zealandwouldmaketo its Act in relationto
digital technologywouldbeconsistentwith theWCT, butno specificrecommendationwasmade
aboutaccedingto theWCT.

Similarly, areviewofperformers’rightsrecommendedthatNewZealandnot accedeto theWPPT
asextensionto performers’rights in theAct wasconsideredunnecessary5.Therefore,whileboth
AustraliaandNewZealandadhereto theobligationsin relationto performers’rightsunderthe
World TradeOrganisationTradeRelatedAspectsof IntellectualPropertyRightsagreement,
Australiawill providefor greaterscopeofprotectionofperformers’rightsin accordancewith the
WPPT. This includesprovidingmoralrights for performers.

Otherissues

Therearealsootherdifferencesin thepolicy andadministrationofAustralianandNewZealand
copyrightlaw. For example,statutorylicencesin theAustralianCopyrightAct alloweducational
institutionsandgovernmentsto copymaterialprovidingtheypayequitableremunerationto a
declaredcollectingsociety. TheNew ZealandAct createsbroadexceptionswhich allow
educationalestablishmentsto copymaterialfor educationalpurposesandtheseexceptionsareonly
limited to the extentthata licensingschemeis availableto coverthecopying.

2 Section26 copyrightAct 1994(NZ)

~Section27
~CabinetPaper,Digital TechnologyandtheCopyrightAct 1994,18 June2003 availableat

http://www.med.govt.nz/buslt/inLprop/digital/index.html
~CabinetPaper,Perfonners’rightsReview,3 December2003 availableat

http://www.med.govt.nz/busltlinLprop/performers!cabinetlindex.html
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TheAustralianAct providesthat collectingsocietieswhichadministerstatutorylicencesmustbe
declared.New Zealanddoesnothavethisprocessin placefor educationalandgovernmentuseof
copyrightmaterial. Collectingsocietieshavehighlightedthatthis createsgreateradministrative
hurdlesin gainingremunerationfor educationalandgovernmentcopyingin NewZealand.The
Departmentdoesnot haveaview on this.

7 REGULATION OF THE LEGAL PROFESSION

SincetheDepartment’soriginalsubmission,therehasbeensomeprogressin implementingthe
nationallegalprofessionproject. New SouthWalescommencedits implementinglegislationon
1 October2005andVictoria’s legislationcommencedon 12 December2005. Queenslandis
expectedto amendits legislationin 2006, bringingit in line with thenationalmodel. While all
otherStatesandTerritoriesareexpectedto introduceimplementinglegislationin 2006. It is
fundamentalto thesuccessoftheprojectthatall jurisdictionsimplementthemodelbill assoonas
possible.Otherwise,theregulationofthe legalprofessionwill remainamix ofcontradictorylaws.

In July 2005, SCAG Ministersapprovedthemodel regulationswhich supportthemodelbill. These
havebeenimplementedbyNew SouthWalesandVictoria.

Theworkinggroupestablishedby SCAGundertheMemorandumofUnderstandinghasmet
regularlyandis consideringpossiblechangesto themodel bill. It hasproposednumerous
amendmentsto themodelbill whichMinisters approvedin November2005. Furtheramendments
areexpectedto beput to MinistersattheApril 2006SCAGmeeting. Theworking groupis also
finalising aconsolidatedversionofthemodelbill whichwill bepublicly released.

As notedin theDepartment’soriginal submission,theimplementationofthemodelbill will still
resultin significantareasofdivergencein regulation. TheAustralianGovernmentcontinuesto
pressfor uniformity to thegreatestpossibleextent,soasto minimisecontraryor conflicting
regulationbetweenthejurisdictions. However,thereis an increasingconcernthatthe divergencein
regulationmayunderminetheultimategoalsofthenationallegalprojectto facilitatethe inter-
jurisdictionaltradeoflegal services.

8 DEFAMATION

In thesecondhalfof2005,eachoftheStatesenactedsubstantiallyuniform defamationlawsbased
on themodelprovisionsput forwardin theStateandTerritoryproposal. In early2006,theACT
enactedlawsbasedon themodelprovisions. TheNorthernTerritory is expectedto enactlaws
during 2006.

TheAustralianGovernmenthasbeenencouragedby theprogressthathasbeenmade. It remains
regrettable,however,that differencesremainbetweenthejurisdictionsin relationto theprovisionof
juries. TheAustralianGovernmentwill continueto supportreformin relationto theprovisionof
alternativeremediesandtherightsofcorporationsto sue.
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9 LAWS IMPACTING ON INDIVIDUALS

9.1 Conveyancing

No updaterequired.

9.2 SuccessionLaw

TheQueenslandLaw ReformCommissionis expectedto finaliseits reportson Intestacyandthe
AdministrationofEstatesearlyin 2006.

In regardsto theReporton Wills, Victoria andtheNorthernTerritoryhaveimplementedthereport
andQueenslandhasabill beforeParliament.However,while the legislationis largelyconsistent
with theQLRC’ s recommendationsthereareareaswherethereis substantialpolicy departure.
Consideringthetime takento developtheproposals,it is disappointingthatalreadythereis
divergencein theimplementationoftheproposalsby theStatesandTerritories.

9.3 PowersofAttorney

No updaterequired.

9.4 StatutoryDeclarations

No updaterequired
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